

Beaver County, Oklahoma  
 County Commissioners Proceedings  
 March 31, 2025

The Board of County Commissioners met in regular session at 9:00 a.m. in the Office of the County Commissioners on March 31, 2025. Notice of the meeting was posted for public information on March 27, 2024 at 4:00 p.m. at the East, West and North entrances to the Beaver County Courthouse and www.beaver.okcounties.org.

Rose called the meeting to order at 9:00 a.m. Those present were C.J. Rose, Chairman; Roy Fleming, Vice-Chairman; Kerry Regier, Member; Scott Mitchell and Kelly Yeomans, County Clerk/Secretary.

Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Regier to approve the minutes of the March 24, 2025 meeting. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Regier to approve the Application for Road Crossing from Ryan Radcliff between Sections 26 & 25-6N-2IECM. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Rose, Aye and Fleming, Aye.

Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Fleming to approve the Application for Road Crossings from PTCI as follows below. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Rose, Aye and Fleming, Aye.  
 Between Sections 7 & 15-6N-28ECM  
 Between Sections 16 & 28-6N-28ECM  
 Between Section 14 & 12-6N-27ECM

9:30 a.m. ~ 6-month bids were opened. Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Fleming to award the bids as follows. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Rose, Aye.

**6 MONTH BID #1**  
**April 7, 2025 to October 6, 2025**

<b>2 2/3 X 1/2 ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE</b>		<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
	16 GA.	
18"	21.40	DUB ROSS
24"	28.40	DUB ROSS
30"	35.42	DUB ROSS
36"	NO BID	NO BID/DUB ROSS
	53.58	

<b>3" X 1" ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE</b>	
53" X 41" 14 GA.	85.50
60" X 46" 14 GA.	96.75
66" X 51" 14 GA.	107.30
73" X 55" 14 GA.	119.50
81" X 59" 14 GA.	128.92
87" X 63" 14 GA.	137.95
95" X 67" 12 GA.	215.30

<b>2 2/3 X 1/2 ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE</b>	
	14 GA.
18"	19.88
24"	26.40
30"	32.88
36"	39.40
48"	60.90

<b>3" X 1" ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE</b>	
60" 16 GA.	75.88
66" 16 GA.	83.95
72" 16 GA.	89.66
78" 16 GA.	99.55
84" 14 GA.	137.79
90" 14 GA.	147.50
96" 14 GA.	157.25
102" 14 GA.	165.95
108" 12 GA.	258.00
114" 12 GA.	270.25
120" 12 GA.	285.40

**6 MONTH BID #2**

<b>CHIPS</b>	<b>TON</b>	<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
1/2"	28.00	J. & R CONSTRUCTORS
3/4"	25.65, as available	DOLESE BROS. CO.
3/8"	26.05, as available	DOLESE BROS. CO.
7/16"	NO BID	NO BID
5/8"	25.85, as available	DOLESE BROS. CO.
<b>SCREENED ROCK</b>	<b>TON</b>	
1 1/4"	19.25	DOLESE BROS. CO.
1 1/2"	18.40	DOLESE BROS. CO.

<b>ASPHALT TYPE HOT MIX</b>	<b>TON</b>
(Supply lay down machine)	NO BID
(No lay down machine) \$109.25	CUMMINS CONSTRUCTION

<b>TACK COAT</b>	<b>GAL.</b>
	NO BID

**POLYMER MODIFIED COLD PATCH TON**

<u>PICKED-UP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
<u>115.00</u>	<u>180.00</u>
<b>50# BAG</b>	
<u>PICKED-UP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
<u>12.50</u>	<u>13.50</u>
	<u>PAVING MATERIALS, LLC</u>
	<u>PAVING MATERIALS, LLC</u>

**HOT MIX -COLD LAY TON**

<u>NO BID</u>
<b>HAULING (Rock, Asphalt &amp; Road Materials)</b>
<u>NO BID</u>
<b>CONCRETE – PER YARD</b>
<u>NO BID</u>
<b>MILEAGE – PER MILE</b> <u>NO BID</u>
<u>NO BID</u>

**6 MONTH BID #3**

<b>MC 70</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	<u>2.62</u>	<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
<b>MC 800</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	<u>2.58</u>	<u>ASPHALT &amp; FUEL SUPPLY</u>
<b>MC 800 +</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	<u>2.68</u>	<u>COSTAL ASPHALT &amp; FUEL</u>
<b>EMULSION – CRS – 2</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	<u>2.13</u>	<u>COASTAL ENERGY CORP.</u>
<b>EMULSION – CRS – 2 +</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	<u>2.35</u>	<u>WRIGHT ASPHALT</u>
			<u>WRIGHT ASPHALT</u>

**RETURN FREIGHT**

½ FREIGHT  
PUMP CHARGE: \$150.00  
DEMURRAGE: \$100/HR – 2 HRS FREE  
MIN FREIGHT – 48,000 LBS  
FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL FEE- \$.00150 PER GAL.

SHORT FREIGHT- \$1,030.00 FOR LOADS LESS THAN 5,500 GALLONS  
PUMP CHARGE: \$125.00  
DEMURRAGE: \$100/HR – 2 HRS FREE

**CASE-BY-CASE BASIS**

COASTAL ENERGY  
ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY

**6 MONTH BID #4**

<b>PILE</b>	<b>L.F.</b>
HP 10X42	<u>31.87</u>
HP 12X53	<u>41.08</u>
10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe	<u>28.98</u>

**PILE DRIVING**

HP 10X42	<u>NO BID</u>
HP 12X53	<u>NO BID</u>
10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe	<u>NO BID</u>
<b>STRUCTURAL STEEL (I&amp;H Beams) A-36</b>	
New	<u>0.91</u>
Used	<u>0.40</u>

**STRUCTURAL STEEL (Angles & Channels) A-36**

New	<u>0.7308</u>
Used	<u>NO BID</u>

**18" GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING**

12 Gauge	<u>NO BID</u>
10 Gauge	<u>\$9.30</u>

**21.7" GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING**

12 Gauge	<u>7.81</u>
10 Gauge	<u>9.94</u>

**2' WIDE GALVANIZED STEEL BRIDGE PLANKS**

12 Gauge	<u>12.22</u>
10 Gauge	<u>15.02</u>

**REBAR GRADE 60**

<b>1/2"</b>	<b>Per Ft.</b>
<u>0.3673</u>	
<b>5/8"</b>	<u>0.5735</u>

**CRANE RENTAL**

15 Ton Minimum NO BID per hour

**TRACKHOE**

NO BID per hour

**FORKLIFT**

NO BID per hour

**FIRM RECEIVING BID**  
THE RAILROAD YARD  
THE RAILROAD YARD  
THE RAILROAD YARD

NO BID  
NO BID  
NO BID  
SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  
THE RAILROAD YARD

THE RAILROAD YARD  
NO BID

NO BID  
SUNBELT EQUIPMENT

THE RAILROAD YARD  
THE RAILROAD YARD

THE RAILROAD YARD  
THE RAILROAD YARD

THE RAILROAD YARD  
THE RAILROAD YARD

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

<b>GUARD RAILING</b>	<b>Per Ft.</b>	<b>SUNBELT EQUIPMENT</b>
New	<u>9.25</u>	<b>THE RAILROAD YARD</b>
Used	<u>3.50</u>	
<b>STAY INPLACE FORMING</b>	<b>Sq. Ft.</b>	<b>THE RAILROAD YARD</b>
22 Gauge	<u>1.716</u>	<b>NO BID</b>
24 Gauge	<u>NO BID</u>	
<b>OKLAHOMA CERTIFIED STRUCTURAL WELDING</b>	<b>Per Hour</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
	<u>NO BID</u>	

**6 MONTH BID #5**

<b>GRADER RADIAL TIRES</b>	<u>645.00</u>	<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
1400 x 24		<b>DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE</b>
<b>TRUCK RADIAL TIRES</b>	<u>225.00</u>	<b>TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE</b>
1100 x 22.5 HIGHWAY		<b>TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE</b>
1100 x 22.5 STEERING	<u>225.00</u>	<b>T&amp;W TIRE</b>
1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON	<u>235.00</u>	<b>T&amp;W TIRE</b>
1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY	<u>235.00</u>	<b>T&amp;W TIRE</b>
1100 x 24.5 STEERING	<u>235.00</u>	<b>T&amp;W TIRE</b>
1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON	<u>235.00</u>	<b>TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE</b>
<b>TRACTOR TIRES</b>	<u>725.00</u>	<b>TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE</b>
18.4 R 38		<b>TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE</b>
14.9 R 28	<u>595.00</u>	<b>TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE</b>
14.9 R 24	<u>385.00</u>	<b>TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE</b>

**6 MONTH BID #6**

<b>GRADER BLADES</b>	<b>PER FT.</b>	<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
5/8 X 6 (WITH 5/8 HOLES)	<u>10.72</u>	<b>WARREN CAT</b>
5/8 X 8 (WITH 5/8 HOLES)	<u>14.75</u>	<b>WARREN CAT</b>
5/8 X 6 (WITH 3/4 HOLES)	<u>10.82</u>	<b>DUB ROSS CO., INC.</b>
5/8 X 8 (WITH 3/4 HOLES)	<u>14.75</u>	<b>WARREN CAT</b>

11:00 a.m. ~ Bid #3 was opened for a 2020 or newer model oil truck and sale or trade of a 2009 International Truck. Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Fleming to open bid #3 from Van Keppel and One Nation Distribution LLC for an oil truck. Bid was awarded to Van Keppel being the lowest bid with details as listed below. Motion carried with voting; Fleming, Aye; Regier, Aye and Rose, Aye. Van Keppel ~\$210,000.00 w/ trade in on 2009 International Truck that was included in Bid packet leaving a bid amount of \$155,000.00

One Nation Distribution LLC ~ \$168,494.00 (They did not provide any details or specs of type of truck, year, or offer any trade in value)

Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Reiger to approve the Sheriff request to hire Daniel Neville as a full time Communication Officer, effective April 1, 2025. Daniel will be paid a monthly salary of \$3,156.62. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Regier to approve the OEDA Reap Affidavit of Completion for Beaver EMS Grant BV25-1. All equipment has been received, installed and paid. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Rose, Aye.

The Board reviewed employee time sheet as follows:  
 Sheriff's Office Deputy/Dispatchers ~ 01/29/25 – 02/25/25  
 General Employees and Highway ~ 2/1/25 – 2/28/25

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to pay the following claims. Motion carried with voting; Fleming, Aye; Regier, Aye and Rose, Aye.

<b>MARCH PR</b>
<b>E-911</b>
000086 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 613.36
000087 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 822.06
000088 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 111.00
000089 OPEH&WP \$ 2,141.38
<b>FAIR ST</b>
000119 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 295.82
000120 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 253.60
000121 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 94.00
<b>GENERAL</b>
000890 AFLAC \$ 1,224.35
000891 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 23,478.78
000892 LEADERS LIFE \$ 135.63
000893 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 23,423.39
000894 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 3,146.00
000895 OPEH&WP \$ 36,251.92
000896 STANDARD RETIREMENT 401 \$ 2,500.00
000897 STANDARD RETIREMENT 457 \$ 2,425.00

**HWY DIST 1,2,3**  
001239 AFLAC \$ 2,252.57  
001240 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 24,930.16  
001241 LEADERS LIFE \$ 123.21  
001242 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 23,966.04  
001243 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 3,294.00  
001244 OPEH&WP \$ 44,455.79  
001245 STANDARD RETIREMENT 401 \$ 3,025.00  
001246 STANDARD RETIREMENT 457 \$ 3,450.00  
**LIBRARY HLTH LIT. GRANT**  
000020 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 49.80  
000021 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 65.10  
**LIBRARY ST**  
000071 AFLAC \$ 114.47  
000072 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 418.63  
000073 LEADERS LIFE \$ 39.00  
000074 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 117.44  
000075 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 67.00  
000076 OPEH&WP \$ 5.00  
000077 STANDARD RETIREMENT 457 \$ 100.00  
**LIBRARY STATE AID GRANT**  
000016 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 234.06  
000017 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 1.00  
**GENERAL USE ST**  
000092 AFLAC \$ 92.90  
000093 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 1,890.79  
000094 LEADERS LIFE \$ 160.37  
000095 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 834.59  
000096 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 479.00  
000097 OPEH&WP \$ 762.28  
000098 STANDARD RETIREMENT 457 \$ 500.00  
**FIRST SECURITY BANK ~ WH; OTC ~ WH; OPERS ~ RETIREMENT; OPEH&WP ~ INS.; STANDARD RETIREMENT ~ DC; AFLAC ~ INS.; LEADERS LIFE ~ INS.**

There being no other business to come before the board at this time, the board adjourned at 11:15 a.m.  
Voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

  
\_\_\_\_\_  
C.J. Rose, Chairman

  
\_\_\_\_\_  
Roy Fleming, Vice-Chairman

  
\_\_\_\_\_  
Kerry Regier, Member



Attest:  


Kelly Yeomans, County Clerk  
Secretary, Board of County Commissioners