

Beaver County, Oklahoma
County Commissioners Proceedings
September 30, 2024

The Board of County Commissioners met in regular session at 9:00 a.m. in the Office of the County Commissioners on September 30 2024. Notice of the meeting was posted for public information on September 26, 2024 at 4:00 p.m. at the East, West and North entrances to the Beaver County Courthouse and www.beaver.okcounties.org.

Regier called the meeting to order at 9:00 a.m. Those present were Kerry Regier, Chairman; C.J. Rose, Vice-Chairman; Roy Fleming, Member; Reuben Parker, Scott Mitchell, Janessa Davis-O'Reilly, Sarah Whiteley and Kelly Yeomans, County Clerk/Secretary.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to approve the minutes of the September 23, 2024 meeting. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

9:30 ~ 6 Month Bid Opening. Janessa Davis-O'Reilly and Sarah Whiteley, County Clerk Deputies assisted with the bids. Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to award the bids as follows. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

6 MONTH BID #1
OCTOBER 7, 2024 TO APRIL 7, 2025

2 2/3 X 1/2 ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE	FIRM RECEIVING BID
16 GA. 14 GA.	
18" CO. <u>21.44</u> <u>27.15</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS</u>
24" CO. <u>28.38</u> <u>33.51</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS</u>
30" CO. <u>35.42</u> <u>44.78</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS</u>
36" CO. <u>NO BID</u> <u>53.58</u>	<u>NO BID & DUB ROSS CO.</u>

3" X 1" ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE

53" X 41" 14 GA. <u>85.47</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
60" X 46" 14 GA. <u>96.72</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
66" X 51" 14 GA. <u>107.27</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
73" X 55" 14 GA. <u>119.50</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
81" X 59" 14 GA. <u>128.90</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
87" X 63" 14 GA. <u>137.92</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
95" X 67" 12 GA. <u>215.28</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>

2 2/3 X 1/2 ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE

14 GA.	
18" <u>19.95</u>	<u>DUB ROSS & DUB ROSS</u>
24" <u>26.40</u>	<u>DUB ROSS & DUB ROSS</u>
30" <u>32.95</u>	<u>DUB ROSS & DUB ROSS</u>
36" <u>39.46</u>	<u>DUB ROSS & DUB ROSS</u>
48" <u>60.96</u>	<u>DUB ROSS & DUB ROSS</u>
3" X 1" ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE	
60" 16 GA. <u>77.88</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
66" 16 GA. <u>84.43</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
72" 16 GA. <u>89.66</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
78" 16 GA. <u>99.55</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
84" 14 GA. <u>137.79</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
90" 14 GA. <u>147.52</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
96" 14 GA. <u>157.25</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
102" 14 GA. <u>166.45</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
108" 12 GA. <u>258.00</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
114" 12 GA. <u>272.25</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>
120" 12 GA. <u>286.45</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO.</u>

6 MONTH BID #2

CHIPS	FIRM RECEIVING BID
1/2" TON	
3/4" <u>28.00</u>	<u>J&R SAND</u>
3/8" <u>21.65</u>	<u>DOLESE BROS.</u>
7/16" <u>22.05 AS AVAILABLE</u>	<u>DOLESE BROS.</u>
5/8" <u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
	<u>DOLESE BROS.</u>
	<u>DOLESE BROS.</u>
SCREENED ROCK	
1 1/4" TON	
1 1/2" <u>17.25</u>	<u>DOLESE BROS.</u>
	<u>B & S SAND AND GRAVEL</u>
	<u>NO BID</u>
ASPHALT TYPE HOT MIX	
(Supply lay down machine) <u>NO BID</u>	
(No lay down machine) <u>110.00</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
TACK COAT	
	<u>NO BID</u>
	<u>NO BID</u>
POLYMER MODIFIED COLD PATCH TON	
<u>PICKED-UP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
<u>126.50</u>	<u>207.65 MINIMUM 25 TONS</u>
50# BAG	<u>DELIVERED</u>
<u>12.50</u>	<u>15.50 MINIMUM 50 BAGS</u>
HOT MIX -COLD LAY TON	
	<u>NO BID</u>
	<u>LOGAN CO. ASPHALT</u>
	<u>LOGAN CO. ASPHALT</u>
	<u>NO BID</u>

HAULING (Rock, Asphalt & Road Materials)
 (Bid per T. plus mileage) NO BID
CONCRETE – PER YARD NO BID
MILEAGE – PER MILE NO BID

6 MONTH BID #3

MC 70 GAL. 2.56
 MC 800 GAL. 2.49
 MC 800 + GAL. 2.69
 EMULSION – CRS – 2 GAL. 2.19
 EMULSION – CRS – 2 + GAL. 2.41

FIRM RECEIVING BID

COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.

RETURN FREIGHT

PUMP CHARGE: \$125.00
 DEMURRAGE: \$100.00/HR. AFTER 2 FREE HOURS
 SHORT FREIGHT: \$1,030.00 FOR LOADS LESS THAN 5,500 GAL.

COASTAL ENERGY CORP.

6 MONTH BID #4

PILE
 L.F.
 HP 10X42 32.63
 HP 12X53 41.75
 10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe 29.95

FIRM RECEIVING BID

SUNBELT
SUNBELT
SUNBELT

PILE DRIVING

HP 10X42 NO BID
 HP 12X53 NO BID
 10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

STRUCTURAL STEEL (I&H Beams) A-36

New Per lb. 0.84
 Used Per lb. 0.40

SUNBELT
THE RAILROAD YARD

STRUCTURAL STEEL (Angles & Channels) A-36

New Per lb. 0.8144
 Used Per lb. 0.40

THE RAILROAD YARD
THE RAILROAD YARD

18" GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID
 10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 8.53

NO BID
SUNBELT

21.7" GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 7.18
 10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 9.13

THE RAILROAD YARD
THE RAILROAD YARD

2' WIDE GALVANIZED STEEL BRIDGE PLANKS

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 11.91
 10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 14.64

THE RAILROAD YARD
THE RAILROAD YARD

REBAR GRADE 60

1/2" Per Ft. 0.37
 5/8" Per Ft. 0.57

THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT

CRANE RENTAL

15-Ton Minimum per hour NO BID
 TRACKHOE per hour NO BID
 FORKLIFT per hour NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

GUARD RAILING

New Per Ft. 8.66
 Used Per Ft. 4.00

SUNBELT
SUNBELT

STAY INPLACE FORMING

22 Gauge Sq. Ft. 1.85
 24 Gauge NO BID

THE RAILROAD YARD
NO BID

OKLAHOMA CERTIFIED STRUCTURAL WELDING

Per Hour NO BID

NO BID

6 MONTH BID #5

GRADER RADIAL TIRES

1400 x 24 587.24

FIRM RECEIVING BID

DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

TRUCK RADIAL TIRES

1100 x 22.5 HIGHWAY 220.00
 1100 x 22.5 STEERING 210.00
 1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON 210.00
 1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY 230.00
 1100 x 24.5 STEERING 230.00
 1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON 225.00

T & W TIRE
T & W TIRE
T & W TIRE
DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
DIRECT DISCOUNT AND T & W
T & W TIRE

TRACTOR TIRES

18.4 R 38 800.00
 14.9 R 28 540.00
 14.9 R 24 459.00

DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
T & W TIRE
DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

GRADER BLADES

PER FT.

5/8" X 6 (WITH 5/8 HOLES) 10.82
 5/8" X 8 (WITH 5/8 HOLES) 14.00
 5/8" X 6 (WITH 3/4 HOLES) 10.82
 5/8" X 8 (WITH 3/4 HOLES) 14.00

6 MONTH BID #6

FIRM RECEIVING BID

DUB ROSS CO. INC.
ELKHORN MACHINERY
DUB ROSS CO. INC
ELKHORN MACHINERY

Motion was made by Fleming and seconded by Regier to amend FY25 Requesting Officers and Receiving Agents as follows: Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

OFFICE REQUISITIONING OFFICERS RECEIVING AGENTS

Sheriff Reuben Parker Julie Lemieux & Kelsie Kile
Court Clerk Tammie Patzkowsky & Debra Bobeck Lori Elfers & Tala Gillenwaters
Rural Econ Kerry Regier & Kelly Yeomans Taylor Trippet

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Fleming to approve the Sheriff request to move Sierra Caldwell from part time to full time Dispatcher, effective October 1, 2024. She will be paid full salary of \$3,156.62 with no probationary period. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Fleming to approve the Sheriff request to move Dally Conway from part time to full time Dispatcher, effective October 1, 2024. She will be paid full salary of \$3,156.62 with no probationary period. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to deposit the following checks in the Treasurer's Office. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Regier, Aye and Fleming, Aye.
Check---State Election Board (Secretary Salary Reimb.) -----Rec. #129---\$3,375.00
Check---Beaver County (Garn. Fee) -----Rec. #130---\$5.00

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Fleming to approve September payroll. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to pay the following claims. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Rose, Aye.

GEN. GOV. ST

5, COPPERHEAD COATINGS, 6587.35, FLOORING/REPAIRS

SEPTEMBER PR

E-911

000025 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 795.41
000026 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 671.07
000027 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 179.00
000028 OPEH&WP* \$ 1,802.80
000029 STANDARD RETIREMENT 401 \$ 100.00
000030 STANDARD RETIREMENT 457 \$ 125.00
FAIR ST
000043 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 315.19
000044 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 266.28
000045 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 97.00
GENERAL
000276 AFLAC \$ 1,780.20
000277 BEAVER COUNTY \$ 5.00
000278 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 21,608.67
000279 LEADERS LIFE \$ 135.63
000280 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 20,067.67
000281 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 2,689.00
000282 OPEH&WP \$ 36,223.02
000283 STANDARD RETIREMENT 401 \$ 2,250.00
000284 STANDARD RETIREMENT 457 \$ 2,250.00
000285 YOXALL ANTRIM & FRYMIRE \$ 300.00
HWY DIST 1,2,3

000363 AFLAC \$ 2,487.78
000364 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 26,083.31
000365 LEADERS LIFE \$ 123.21
000366 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 24,308.60
000367 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 3,454.00
000368 OPEH&WP \$ 45,224.11 Payroll
000369 STANDARD RETIREMENT 401 \$ 3,025.00
000370 STANDARD RETIREMENT 457 \$ 3,550.00
LIBRARY ST
000018 AFLAC \$ 114.47
000019 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 425.29
000020 LEADERS LIFE \$ 39.00
000021 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 117.44
000022 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 67.00
000023 OPEH&WP \$ 5.00
000024 STANDARD RETIREMENT 457 \$ 100.00
LIBRARY STATE AID GRANT
000002 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 26.56
GENERAL USE ST
000029 AFLAC \$ 31.50
000030 FIRST SECURITY BANK \$ 1,314.90
000031 LEADERS LIFE \$ 160.37
000032 O.P.E.R.S. \$ 367.97
000033 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION \$ 369.00
000034 OPEH&WP \$ 386.14
000035 STANDARD RETIREMENT 457 \$ 300.00

**FIRST SECURITY BANK ~ WH; OPERS ~ RETIREMENT; OPEH&WP ~ INS.; STANDARD RETIREMENT ~ DC;
AFLAC ~ INS.; LEADERS LIFE ~ INS.; YOXALL ET AL ~ GARNISHMENT**

There being no other business to come before the board at this time, the board adjourned at 10:30 a.m.
Voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.


Kerry Regier, Chairman


C.J. Rose, Vice-Chairman


Roy Fleming, Member




Kelly Yeomans, County Clerk
Secretary, Board of County Commissioners