

Beaver County, Oklahoma  
County Commissioners Proceedings  
March 25, 2024

The Board of County Commissioners met in regular session at 9:00 a.m. in the Office of the County Commissioners on March 25 2024. Notice of the meeting was posted for public information on March 21, 2024 at 4:00 p.m. at the East, West and North entrances to the Beaver County Courthouse and www.beaver.okcounties.org.

Regier called the meeting to order at 9:00 a.m. Those present were Kerry Regier, Chairman; C.J. Rose, Vice-Chairman; Roy Fleming, Member, Reuben Parker, Scott Mitchell, Chuck Lemieux, Janessa Davis, Sarah Whiteley and Kelly Yeomans, County Clerk/Secretary.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to approve the minutes of the March 11, 2024 meeting. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Lemieux gave the Board a brief update regarding the Assessor's office. He informed them value notices have been sent out.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to approve the Application for Road Crossing from PTCI between Sections 31-5N-21 & 36-5N-20ECM. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to approve the OEDA REAP Affidavit of Completion for Turpin RWD #1 Grant BV23-3. All Meters/Equipment have been received and installed. Invoices are being approved in the amount of \$43,692.00. PO#3660 to Fortiline in the amount of \$39,322.80. Turpin RWD will pay the remaining \$4,369.20 for their leverage amount towards the grant. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Rose, Aye and Fleming, Aye.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to approve the OEDA REAP Affidavit of Completion for Beaver FD Grant BV23-4. Ford F550 Super crew Cab & Chassis has been received. Invoices are being approved in the amount of \$60,574.07. PO#1439 to Joe Cooper Ford of Yukon in the amount of \$60,574.07. Beaver FD ST will pay the remaining \$10,510.93, PO#1440 for their leverage amount towards the grant. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Rose, Aye and Fleming, Aye.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Fleming, to approve a Cancellation of Anticipated Appropriations in FY23 for Turpin RWD #1 OEDA Reap Grant BV23-3 in the amount of \$9,970.23. The total amount of the grant received was not used so in order to clear the account out we will zero the account out. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

9:30 ~ 6 Month Bids were opened. Janessa Davis and Sarah Whiteley, County Clerk Deputies assisted with the bids. Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to award the bids as follows. Motion carried with voting; Fleming, Aye; Rose, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Fleming to approve the Resolution to fulfill the unexpired term of Jason Hein on the Fair Board and appoint Hunter Wilkerson as a fair board member for Office #3, Dist. #1. The term will be from March 25, 2024 to January 31, 2028. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Regier, Aye and Fleming, Aye.

Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Regier to approve Request for Purchase Order from General Government Sales Tax Account #Cash-66D ~ 1306-1-8020-2005 as follows. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Fair-----Laverne Lumber (Supplies)-----PO #2958---\$750.00

Fair-----Beaver Auto Supply (Bulbs for Grandstands) -----PO #2956---\$150.00

Emerg. Mgmt.-Meyers Auto Body (Repairs/Drivers Side Mirror-MVA) -----PO #3019---\$500.00

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to deposit the following checks in the Treasurer's Office. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Regier, Aye and Fleming, Aye.

Check---CED #8 (Material Request Program/Dist. #3) -----\$60,000.00

9:30 ~ 6 Month Bid Opening. Janessa Davis and Sarah Whiteley, County Clerk Deputies, assisted with the bids. Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to award the bids as follows. Motion carried with voting; Fleming, Aye; Regier, Aye and Rose, Aye.

BEAVER COUNTY  
6 MONTH BID #1  
APRIL 1, 2024 TO OCTOBER 7, 2024

2 2 3 X 1/2 ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE

18"	16 GA.	21.39	26.86
24"		28.50	35.58
30"		35.27	44.30
36"	NO.BID		52.99

FIRM RECEIVING BID

DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.  
DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.  
DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.  
NO BID & DUB ROSS CO.

3" X 1" ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE

53" X 41" 14 GA.	82.35
60" X 46" 14 GA.	92.41
66" X 51" 14 GA.	102.49
73" X 55" 14 GA.	112.58
81" X 59" 14 GA.	122.66
87" X 63" 14 GA.	131.95
95" X 67" 12 GA.	208.40

DUB ROSS CO.  
DUB ROSS CO.  
DUB ROSS CO.  
DUB ROSS CO.  
DUB ROSS CO.  
DUB ROSS CO.  
DUB ROSS CO.

**2 2/3 X 1/2 ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE**

18"	16 GA.	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
24"	19.99	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
30"	26.45	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
36"	32.97	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
48"	38.19	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
	60.98	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.

**3" X 1" ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE**

60" 16 GA.	75.40	DUB ROSS CO.
66" 16 GA.	82.82	DUB ROSS CO.
72" 16 GA.	90.83	DUB ROSS CO.
78" 16 GA.	97.65	DUB ROSS CO.
84" 14 GA.	133.48	DUB ROSS CO.
90" 14 GA.	142.91	DUB ROSS CO.
96" 14 GA.	151.35	DUB ROSS CO.
102" 14 GA.	161.76	DUB ROSS CO.
108" 12 GA.	242.40	DUB ROSS CO.
114" 12 GA.	255.75	DUB ROSS CO.
120" 12 GA.	275.77	DUB ROSS CO.

**6 MONTH BID #2**

<b>CHIPS</b>	<b>TON</b>	<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
1/2"	NO BID	NO BID
3/4"	21.65	DOLESE BROS.
3/8"	22.05 AS AVAILABLE	DOLESE BROS.
7/16"	NO BID	NO BID
5/8"	21.85 AS AVAILABLE	DOLESE BROS.
<b>SCREENED ROCK</b>	<b>TON</b>	<b>DOLESE BROS.</b>
1 1/4"	17.25	DOLESE BROS.
1 1/2"	16.40	
<b>ASPHALT TYPE HOT MIX</b> (Supply lay down machine)	<b>TON</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
(No lay down machine)	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TACK COAT</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
	NO BID	

**POLYMER MODIFIED COLD PATCH**

<b>TON</b>	<i>DELIVERED</i>	LOGAN CO. ASPHALT
	<i>PICKED-UP</i>	
	126.50	207.65 MINIMUM 25 TONS
<b>50# BAG</b>	<i>PICKED-UP</i>	LOGAN CO. ASPHALT
	12.50	15.50 MINIMUM 50 BAGS

**HOT MIX -COLD LAY TON**

NO BID

**HAULING (Rock, Asphalt & Road Materials)**

(Bid per T, plus miteage) NO BID NO BID

**CONCRETE – PER YARD**

NO BID

MILEAGE – PER MILE NO BID

**6 MONTH BID #3**

<b>MC 70</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	3.09	<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
<b>MC 800</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	2.85	COASTAL ENERGY
<b>MC 800 +</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	2.99	COASTAL ENERGY
<b>EMULSION – CRS – 2</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	2.34	WRIGHT ASPHALT
<b>EMULSION – CRS – 2 +</b>	<b>GAL.</b>	2.49	WRIGHT ASPHALT
<b>RETURN FREIGHT</b>			
<b>PUMP CHARGE: \$125.00</b>			
<b>DEMURRAGE: \$100.00/HR AFTER 2 FREE HOURS</b>			
<b>SHORT FREIGHT: \$1,030.00 FOR LOADS LESS THAN 5,500 GAL.</b>			COASTAL ENERGY

**FULL FREIGHT, HALF FREIGHT BACK**

DEMURRAGE: \$75.00/HR. 2 HRS FREE

PUMP: \$100.00 – MIN. LOAD 5,500 GAL

WRIGHT ASPHALT

**6 MONTH BID #4**

<b>PILE</b>	<b>L.F.</b>	<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
HP 10X42	31.69	THE RAILROAD YARD
HP 12X53	42.59	THE RAILROAD YARD
10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe	28.50	THE RAILROAD YARD
<b>PILE DRIVING</b>		
HP 10X42	NO BID	NO BID
HP 12X53	NO BID	NO BID
10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe	NO BID	NO BID
<b>STRUCTURAL STEEL (I&amp;H Beams) A-36</b>		
New Per lb.	0.85	SUNBELT
Used Per lb.	0.40	THE RAILROAD YARD
<b>STRUCTURAL STEEL (Angles &amp; Channels) A-36</b>		
New Per lb.	0.83	SUNBELT
Used Per lb.	0.40	THE RAILROAD YARD
<b>18" GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING</b>		
12 Gauge	Sq. Ft.	NO BID
10 Gauge	Sq. Ft.	NO BID

**21.7" GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING**

12 Gauge	Sq. Ft.	<u>7.95</u>	<u>THE RAILROAD YARD</u>
10 Gauge	Sq. Ft.	<u>9.89</u>	<u>THE RAILROAD YARD</u>

**2' WIDE GALVANIZED STEEL BRIDGE PLANKS**

12 Gauge	Sq. Ft.	<u>13.89</u>	<u>THE RAILROAD YARD</u>
10 Gauge	Sq. Ft.	<u>17.19</u>	<u>THE RAILROAD YARD</u>

**REBAR GRADE 60**

	<b>Per Ft.</b>		
1/2"	<u>0.38</u>		<u>SUNBELT</u>
5/8"	<u>0.57</u>		<u>SUNBELT</u>

**CRANE RENTAL**

15 Ton Minimum	per hour	<u>NO BID</u>	
<b>TRACKHOE</b>	per hour	<u>NO BID</u>	

<b>FORKLIFT</b>	per hour	<u>NO BID</u>	
-----------------	----------	---------------	--

**GUARD RAILING**

New	<b>Per Ft.</b>	<u>9.25</u>	
Used		<u>5.25</u>	

**STAY INPLACE FORMING**

22 Gauge	<b>Sq. Ft.</b>	<u>1.55</u>	<u>THE RAILROAD YARD</u>
24 Gauge		<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>

**OKLAHOMA CERTIFIED STRUCTURAL WELDING**

Per Hour	<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
----------	---------------	---------------

**6 MONTH BID #5****GRADER RADIAL TIRES**

1400 x 24	<u>420.00</u>	<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
-----------	---------------	---------------------------

**TRUCK RADIAL TIRES**

1100 x 22.5 HIGHWAY	<u>229.00</u>	<u>T &amp; W TIRE</u>
1100 x 22.5 STEERING	<u>229.00</u>	
1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON	<u>230.00</u>	<u>DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE</u>
1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY	<u>235.00</u>	<u>TIRE DEALERS WAREH.</u>
1100 x 24.5 STEERING	<u>235.00</u>	<u>DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE</u>
1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON	<u>250.00</u>	<u>TIRE DEALERS WAREH.</u>

**TRACTOR TIRES**

18.4 R 38	<u>720.00</u>	<u>T &amp; W TIRE</u>
14.9 R 28	<u>580.00</u>	<u>T &amp; W TIRE</u>
14.9 R 24	<u>425.00</u>	<u>TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE</u>

**6 MONTH BID #6****GRADER BLADES**

	<b>PER FT.</b>	<b>FIRM RECEIVING BID</b>
5/8 X 6 (WITH 5/8 HOLES)	<u>11.53</u>	<u>WARREN CAT - AMARILLO</u>
5/8 X 8 (WITH 5/8 HOLES)	<u>16.39</u>	<u>WARREN CAT - AMARILLO</u>
5/8 X 6 (WITH 3/4 HOLES)	<u>11.90</u>	<u>DUB ROSS CO. INC</u>
5/8 X 8 (WITH 3/4 HOLES)	<u>16.39</u>	<u>WARREN CAT - AMARILLO</u>

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Fleming to approve March payroll. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Regier, Aye and Fleming, Aye.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Rose to pay the following claims. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Rose, Aye

**FY23****TURPIN RWD REAP OEDA GRANT**

16, FORTILINE, 39322.80, WATER METERS

**FY24****GEN GOV**

861, QUADIENT LEASING, 624.63, POSTAGE RENTAL; 862, WEST TEXAS GAS, 545.91, UTILITY; 863, OTIS ELEVATOR, 3918.12, MAINTENANCE

**SHERIFF**

864, BEAVER SUPPLY, 67.75, SUPPLIES; 865, BEAVER AUTO SUPPLY, 222.36, SUPPLIES; 866, CLEANERS, 98.82, UNIFORM CLEANING; 867, SOUTHERN OFFICE, 305.58, SUPPLIES; 868, SOS LEASING, 368.01, COPIER LEASE; 869, BEAVER COUNTY NURSING HOME, 4207.00, MEALS

**LIBRARY**

870, WEST TEXAS GAS, 136.89, UTILITY

**HWY DIST #2**

1236, ROSE, CJ, 100.50, TRAVEL; 1237, WEST TEXAS GAS, 274.61, UTILITY

**HWY DIST #3**

1238, FRONK OIL, 20074.95, DIESEL; 1239, RURAL WATER DISTRICT NO. 1, 40.00, UTILITY; 1240, WEST TEXAS GAS, 40.17, UTILITY

**CIRB DIST #3**

1241, SAFETY-KLEEN, 172.12, SERVICE; 1242, CIRCUIT ENGINEERING DIST. #8, 47.25, SIGNS; 1243, CIRCUIT ENGINEERING DIST. #8, 84.00, BRIDGE SUPPLIES

**RESALE**

25, HUMBERTO RUIZ, 35.00, TAX CORRECTION

**SHERIFF 4COM**

17, TIGER COMMISSARY, 263.50, COMMISSARY

**SHERIFF CASH**

107, LEWIS CHEVROLET OF LIBERAL, 212.62, REPAIRS; 108, STALKER RADAR, 4700.00, RADAR; 109, G & G ELECTRONICS, 240.05, REPAIRS; 110, NICHOLS WATER, 1842.10, UNIT REPAIRS; 111, METRO EMERGENCY UPFITTERS, 3230.00, LIGHTS

**SHERIFF 4DOC**

112, COMMUNITY PHARMACY, 66.53, INMATE MEDICATION; 113, DOWNINGS MARKET, 28.68, SUPPLIES

**SHERIFF CHS**

114, ACE REMODELS & REPAIR, 585.00, BULLETPROOF MATERIAL

**GEN GOV ST**

64, BEAVER SUPPLY, 349.53, SUPPLIES; 65, TRI STATE HEATING, 853.00, REPAIRS

**FAIR ST**

140, BEAVER SUPPLY, 183.84, SUPPLIES; 141, WEST TEXAS GAS, 1292.68, UTILITY

**HEALTH DEPT ST**

111, BEAVER COUNTY, 300.00, JANITORIAL SERVICE; 112, TOWN OF BEAVER, 92.09, UTILITY; 113, TRI CO ELECTRIC, 323.80, UTILITY

**FORGAN FD ST**

89, NICHOLS, 64.58, FUEL

**TURPIN FD ST**

90, WEST TEXAS GAS, 157.38, UTILITY

**BALKO FD ST**

91, WEST TEXAS GAS, 195.91, UTILITY

**BEAVER FD ST**

92, JOE COOPER FORD OF YUKON, 10510.93, TRUCK; 93, PERRYTON EQUITY, 837.06, FUEL

**FORGAN SR CIT ST**

143, EARTH ANGELS, 175.00, JANITORIAL SERVICE; 144, SHIRLEY J RIGDON, 175.00,

COOK/MEAL; 145, WEST TEXAS GAS, 92.63, UTILITY

**BEAVER SR CIT ST**

146, WEST TEXAS GAS, 151.65, UTILITY

**TURPIN SR CIT ST**

147, DANIA CORAL MIRANDA, 200.00, JANITORIAL SERVICE; 148, WEST TEXAS GAS, 121.31, UTILITY

**MUSEUM ST**

27, WEST TEXAS GAS, 101.00, UTILITY

**ECO DEV ST**

27, WEST TEXAS GAS, 47.66, UTILITY

**BEAVER FD OEDA REAP GRANT**

1, JOE COOPER FORD OF YUKON, 60574.07, TRUCK

There being no other business to come before the board at this time, the board adjourned at 11:30 a.m.  
Voting; Fleming, Aye; Regier, Aye and Rose, Aye.

  
Kerry Regier, Chairman

  
C.J. Rose, Vice-Chairman

  
Roy Fleming, Member



Attest.



Kelly Yeomans, County Clerk  
Secretary, Board of County Commissioners