

Beaver County, Oklahoma  
County Commissioners Proceedings  
March 27, 2023

The Board of County Commissioners met in regular session at 9:00 a.m. in the Office of the County Commissioners on March 27, 2023. Notice of the meeting was posted for public information on March 23, 2023 at 4:00 p.m. at the East, West and North entrances to the Beaver County Courthouse and www.beaver.okcounties.org.

Fleming called the meeting to order at 9:00 a.m. Those presents were Roy Fleming, Chairman; Kerry Regier, Vice-Chairman; C.J. Rose, Member, Shawn Campbell, Scott Mitchell, Chuck Lemieux, and Kelly Yeomans, County Clerk/Secretary.

Motion was made Fleming and seconded by Rose to approve the minutes of the March 20, 2023 meeting. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Lemieux gave a brief update on the oil and gas assessments.

Motion was made by Regier and seconded by Fleming to approve the agreement between Beaver County, ODOT and Balko Public Schools to allow District #3 to maintain the flashing lights for Balko School. Approved by ADA, Tom Jones. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Rose, Aye.

Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Fleming to approve Resolution #8037 to increase the county 401 matching portion from \$75.00 to \$100.00. This was discussed at the last Excise Board but no action was taken but they were in agreement with the increase. Will be on the Excise agenda this month for official approval. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

9:30 ~ 6 Month Bids were opened. Kelsey Short and Janessa Davis, County Clerk Deputies assisted with the bids. Motion was made by Fleming and seconded by Regier to award the bids as follows. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

BEAVER COUNTY  
6 MONTH BID #1  
APRIL 3, 2023 to OCTOBER 2, 2023

	2 2/3 X 1/2 ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE 16 GA. 14 GA.	FIRM RECEIVING BID
18"	<u>23.69</u> 29.95	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
24"	<u>31.39</u> 39.66	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
30"	<u>39.08</u> 49.39	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
36"	<u>NO BID</u> 59.09	NO BID & DUB ROSS CO.
	3" X 1" ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE	
53" X 41" 14 GA.	<u>91.22</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
60" X 46" 14 GA.	<u>102.38</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
66" X 51" 14 GA.	<u>113.55</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
73" X 55" 14 GA.	<u>124.73</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
81" X 59" 14 GA.	<u>135.90</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
87" X 63" 14 GA.	<u>147.07</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
95" X 67" 12 GA.	<u>224.06</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
	2 2/3 X 1/2 ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE	
16 GA. 14 GA.		
18"	<u>22.57</u> 28.52	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
24"	<u>29.90</u> 37.78	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
30"	<u>37.22</u> 47.04	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
36"	<u>44.55</u> 56.28	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
48"	<u>68.83</u> 86.88	DUB ROSS CO. & DUB ROSS CO.
	3" X 1" ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE	
60" 16 GA.	<u>85.68</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
66" 16 GA.	<u>94.11</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
72" 16 GA.	<u>102.55</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
78" 16 GA.	<u>110.96</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
84" 14 GA.	<u>150.71</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
90" 14 GA.	<u>161.35</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
96" 14 GA.	<u>171.99</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
102" 14 GA.	<u>182.63</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
108" 12 GA.	<u>273.68</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
114" 12 GA.	<u>288.75</u>	DUB ROSS CO.
120" 12 GA.	<u>303.80</u>	DUB ROSS CO.

BEAVER COUNTY  
6 MONTH BID #2  
APRIL 3, 2023 to OCTOBER 2, 2023

CHIPS	TON	FIRM RECEIVING BID
1/2"	<u>26.00</u>	J & R SAND CO.
3/4"	<u>NO BID</u>	NO BID



10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID NO BID

**2' WIDE GALVANIZED STEEL BRIDGE PLANKS**

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID

**REBAR GRADE 60** Per Ft.

1/2" .47

5/8" .73

**CRANE RENTAL**

15 Ton Minimum per hour

**TRACKHOE** per hour

**FORKLIFT** per hour

**GUARD RAILING**

New

Used

**STAY INPLACE FORMING**

22 Gauge Sq. Ft. 2.25

24 Gauge NO BID

**OKLAHOMA CERTIFIED STRUCTURAL WELDING**

Per Hour 85.00

**BEAVER COUNTY**

**6 MONTH BID #5**

**APRIL 3, 2023 to OCTOBER 2, 2023**

**GRADER RADIAL TIRES**

1400 x 24 500.00

**TRUCK RADIAL TIRES**

1100 x 22.5 HIGHWAY 265.00

WAREHOUSE

1100 x 22.5 STEERING 265.00

WAREHOUSE

1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON 275.00

WAREHOUSE

1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY 275.00

1100 x 24.5 STEERING 275.00

1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON 285.00

**TRACTOR TIRES**

18.4 R 38

14.9 R 28

14.9 R 24

750.00

595.00

480.00

**BEAVER COUNTY**

**6 MONTH BID #6**

**APRIL 3, 2023 to OCTOBER 2, 2023**

**GRADER BLADES**

5/8 X 6 (WITH 5/8 HOLES) 11.68

5/8 X 8 (WITH 5/8 HOLES) 16.07

5/8 X 6 (WITH 3/4 HOLES) 12.82

5/8 X 8 (WITH 3/4 HOLES) 16.07

**PER FT.**

11.68

16.07

12.82

16.07

**FIRM RECEIVING BID**

WARREN CAT

WARREN CAT

DUB ROSS CO. INC

WARREN CAT

Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Fleming to approve the Application for Road Crossing from Richard Radcliff between Sections 30 & 31-6N-24ECM. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Motion was made by Fleming and seconded by Regier to approve Request for Purchase Order from ARPA 2021 Account #1566-1-2000-2005 as follows. Motion carried with voting; Fleming, Aye; Rose, Aye and Regier, Aye.

General Gov.-----OTIS (Elevator Yearly Maintenance) -----PO #3098--\$3,804.00

Motion was made by Fleming and seconded by Regier to approve Request for Purchase Order from General Government Sales Tax Account #Cash-66D ~ 1306-1-8020-2005 as follows. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Assessor-----Surveying & Mapping (Land Use Reports) -----PO #3076--\$7,650.00

Motion was made by Fleming and seconded by Rose to deposit the following checks in the Treasurer's Office. Motion carried with voting; Fleming, Aye; Rose, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Check---State Election Board (Election Secretary Salary Reimb.) -----Rec. #519---\$5,916.38

Motion was made by Fleming and seconded by Rose to approve March payroll. Motion carried with voting; Rose, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Regier, Aye.

Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Regier to pay the following claims. Motion carried with voting; Regier, Aye; Fleming, Aye and Rose, Aye.

**COUNTY CLERK**

834, MID-WEST PRINTING 84.75, INVENTORY SHEETS  
GENERAL

835, COUNTY BUDGETING SERVICES, 625.00, BUDGET  
SHERIFF

836, NICHOLS WATER SERVICE, 398.84, UNIT REPAIRS; 837, BEAVER AUTO BATH, 41.75,  
UNIT WASHES; 838, OKLA. SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION, 300.00, MEMBERSHIP DUES 839,  
BEAVER COUNTY NURSING HOME, 2445.45, PRISONER MEALS; 840, MID-WEST PRINTING,  
361.25, COMM. PROCEEDING BOOK

**HWY DIST #1**

1264, FLEMING, ROY G., 103.49, TRAVEL

**HWY DIST #2**

1265, AIRGAS USA, 699.32, SUPPLIES; 1266, SOUTHERN OFFICE, 600.00, ANNUAL SERVICE  
CONTRACT; 1267, MYRIAD MACHINE COMPANY, 60.00, PARTS

**HWY DIST #3**

1268, SAFETY-KLEEN, 159.37, SERVICE; 1269, RURAL WATER DISTRICT NO. 1, 34.90, UTILITY

**CIRB DIST #1**

1270, AIRGAS USA, 70.89, SERVICE; 1271, SAFETY-KLEEN, 110.00, SERVICE; 1272, DIRECT  
DISCOUNT TIRE, 4383.00, GRADER TIRES; 1273, WARREN CAT, 230.00, FUEL SAMPLING KITS;  
1274, WELDON PARTS, 156.16, TRAILER PARTS; 1275, GATE POSTMASTER, 68.00, BOX RENT;  
1276, SOUTHWEST TRAILER, 329.67, TARP MOTOR

**CIRB DIST #2**

1277, CUMMINS CONSTRUCTION, 9843.93, PARTS; 1278, ALL GLASS, 450.00, REPAIRS; 1279,  
SERVICE OKLAHOMA, 30.00, TAG REPLACEMENT

**CIRB DIST #3**

1280, SALCO TRUCK AND TRAILER REPAIR; 6714.83, REPAIRS; 1281, LOCKE SUPPLY, 1450.46,  
SHOP LIGHTS; 1282, SALCO TRUCK AND TRAILER REPAIR; 7632.35, CLUTCH

**E-911**

94, AT&T, 385.94, PHONE

**SHERIFF CASH**

96, STANFIELD PRINTING, 1764.12, SUPPLIES

**SHERIFF 4DOC**

97, FITTS PEST CONTROL, 80.00, PEST CONTROL; 98, OKLA. DEPT. OF PUBLIC SAFETY, 700.00,  
OLETS

**FAIR ST**

90, SHERWIN WILLIAMS, 971.56, PAINT

**HEALTH DEPT ST**

Health-ST 101, DEAL REFRIGERATION, 365.00, MAINTENANCE; 102, QUILL, 352.72, SUPPLIES;  
103, TOWN OF BEAVER, 87.69, UTILITY; 104, TRICO ELECTRIC, 525.21, UTILITY; 105, WEST  
TEXAS GAS, 40.18, UTILITY

**FORGAN SR CIT ST**

151, SHIRLEY J RIGDON, 175.00, COOK/MEAL; 152, EARTH ANGELS, 150.00, JANITORIAL

**TURPIN SR CIT ST**

153, DANIA CORAL MIRANDA, 200.00, JANITORIAL; 154, RURAL WATER DISTRICT NO. 1,  
34.90, UTILITY

There being no other business to come before the board at this time, the board adjourned at 11:15 a.m.  
Voting; Fleming, Aye; Regier, Aye and Rose, Aye.

  
Roy Fleming, Chairman

  
Kerry Regier, Vice-Chairman

  
C.J. Rose, Member



Attest:

  
Kelly Yeomans, County Clerk  
Secretary, Board of County Commissioners