
Beaver County, Oklahoma 
County Commissioners Proceedings 
January 9, 2012 
 
The Board of County Commissioners met in regular session at 9:00 a.m. in the Office of the County 
Commissioners on January 9, 2012.  Notice of the meeting was posted for public information on January 5, 
2012 at 4:00 p.m. at the East and North entrances to the Beaver County Courthouse and 
www.beaver.okcounties.org.  
 
Rose called the meeting to order. Those present were C. J. Rose, Chairman; Brad Raven, Member; Frank 
King, Member; Johnny Roe, Ergon Asphalt and Tammy Millikan, County Clerk/Secretary.   
 
Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Raven to approve the minutes of the January 3, 2012 meeting.  
Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
 
9:30 – Six month bids were opened.  Motion was made by King and seconded by Raven to approve the bids 
as follows.  Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
 

2  2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE  

                                   16 GA.               
18”    11.35 TINHORNS R US                 
18”    10.96 DUB ROSS 
18”   14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

24”   14.85 TINHORNS R US 
24”   14.53 DUB ROSS 
24”   18.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

30”   18.88 TINHORNS R US 
30”   18.09 DUB ROSS 
30”   22.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

36” NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 
36” NO BID DUB ROSS  
36” NO BID TINHORNS R US 

BID AWARDED TO NO BID 

48” NO BID TINHORNS R US 
48” NO BID DUB ROSS 
48” NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO NO BID 

 

2  2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE  

                                   14 GA.               
18”   NO BID TINHORNS R US                   
18”   13.86 DUB ROSS 
18”   NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

24”   17.70 TINHORNS R US 
24”   18.36 DUB ROSS 
24”   NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO TINHORNS R US 

30”   22.50 TINHORNS R US  
30”   22.86 DUB ROSS 
30”   NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO TINHORNS R US 

36”   27.54 TINHORNS R US 
36”   27.35 DUB ROSS 
36”   33.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 
48”                             37.65 TINHORNS R US 
48”                             36.35 DUB ROSS 
48”                             52.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

3” X 1” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE 

53” X 41”   14 GA.  45.68 DUB ROSS 
53” X 41”   14 GA.  48.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 
60” X 46”   14 GA. 50.91 DUB ROSS 
60” X 46”   14 GA. 56.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

66” X 51”  14 GA. 56.47 DUB ROSS 
66” X 51”  14 GA. 60.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

73” X 55”  14 GA. 62.02  DUB ROSS 
73” X 55”  14 GA. 64.00  K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 



81” X 59”  14 GA. 67.58 DUB ROSS  
81” X 59”  14 GA. 73.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

87” X 63”  14 GA. 73.14 DUB ROSS 
87” X 63”  14 GA. 79.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

95” X 67”  12 GA.  114.43 DUB ROSS 
95” X 67”  12 GA.  120.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE 

 16 GA.  
18” 10.59 TINHORNS R US 
18” 13.08 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
18” 10.44 DUB ROSS 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

24” 14.10 TINHORNS R US 
24” 13.84 DUB ROSS 
24” 16.77 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

30” 17.88 TINHORNS R US 
30” 17.23 DUB ROSS 
30” 20.87 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

36” 21.45 TINHORNS R US 
36” 20.62 DUB ROSS 
36” 24.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

48” NO BID TINHORNS R US 
48” 31.90 DUB ROSS   
48” NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

60” NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 
60” NO BID DUB ROSS 
60” NO BID TINHORNS R US 
72” NO BID TINHORNS R US 
72” NO BID DUB ROSS 
72” NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE 

 14 GA.  
18” NO BID TINHORNS R US 
18” 13.20 DUB ROSS   
18” NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

24” 16.90 TINHORNS R US 
24” 17.49 DUB ROSS 
24” NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO TINHORNS R US 

30” 21.45 TINHORNS R US 
30” 21.73 DUB ROSS 
30” NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO TINHORNS R US 

36” 25.75 TINHORNS R US 
36” 26.05 DUB ROSS 
36” NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO TINHORNS R US 

48” 35.75 TINHORNS R US 
48” 34.62 DUB ROSS 
48” 41.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

60” 46.20 TINHORNS R US 
60” 43.18 DUB ROSS 
60” 58.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

72” 55.44 TINHORNS R US 
72” NO BID DUB ROSS 
72” 70.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO TINHORNS R US 

 

3” X 1” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE 

60”     16 GA. 41.65 DUB ROSS 
60”     16 GA. 54.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

66”     16 GA. 45.71 DUB ROSS 
66”     16 GA. 60.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 



72”     16 GA. 50.39 DUB ROSS 
72”     16 GA. 64.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

78”     16 GA. 54.53 DUB ROSS 
78”     16 GA. 70.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

84”     14 GA. 74.06 DUB ROSS 
84”     14 GA. 90.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

90”     14 GA.  79.29 DUB ROSS 
90”     14 GA. 100.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

96”     14 GA. 84.52 DUB ROSS 
96”     14 GA.          105.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

102”   14 GA.  89.75 DUB ROSS 
102”   14 GA.           110.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

108”   12 GA. 136.06 DUB ROSS 
108”   12 GA. 145.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

114”   12 GA. 143.55 DUB ROSS  
114”   12 GA. 160.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

120”   12 GA. 151.04 DUB ROSS 
120”   12 GA. 180.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

CHIPS  TON 

1/2”   17.00 J & R SAND CO 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO 

3/ 4”    8.40 DOLESE BROS. CO 

BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

3/8”     8.80 DOLESE BROS. CO 

BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

5/8”     8.60 DOLESE BROS. CO 

BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

 

SCREENED ROCK                          TON 

1 ¼”  17.00 J & R SAND CO  

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO 

1 ½”     7.40 DOLESE BROS. CO  

BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

 

CRUSHER RUN 

3/4”   5.55 DOLESE BROS. CO 

BIDS AWARED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

1 1/2"  5.35 DOLESE BROS. CO 

BIDS AWARDED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

3”  5.35 DOLESE BROS. CO 

BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

 

 ASPHALT        TON 

 TYPE B 78.00  (NO PAVER) J & R SAND CO 
 TYPE D           85.00  (NO PAVER)       J & R SAND CO 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO  

 TYPE B 90.00   (W/PAVER & 2 OPERATORS) J & R SAND CO 
 TYPE D   98.00   (W/PAVER & 2 OPERATORS)     J & R SAND CO     
       ($400/day to furnish roller & operator for the asphalt provided by J & R Sand Co.) 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO 

 

TACK COAT  GAL.  

     (applied)  3.50 J & R SAND CO 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO  

 

CRACK SEALING (applied) 1.25 LB. B & H PAVING INC. 
  .55 SQ. YARD DONELSON CONST.                 
(Plus 1.77 per pound of material installed.  Contractor will provide equipment, labor, traffic control and 
materials necessary for completion.)  

BID AWARDED TO B & H PAVING INC. 

 

POLYMER PATCH CRACK FILLER   1.75 LB.  APPLIED B & H PAVING INC. 

BID AWARDED TO B & H PAVING INC. 

 

CHIP SEALING       PER MILE   

        2,000.00 PER MILE B & H PAVING INC           
       (Contractor to furnish all labor & equipment. The county will be responsible for providing 



        rock & oil within 5 miles of job site.) 
  1.10 PER SQ. YARD DONELSON CONST.  
       (Contractor will provide rubber modified chip seal oil, asphalt distributor 
       and operator; the County shall provide 3/8” chips applied behind distributor, 
       rollers for compaction, traffic control.) 
                                                            1.18 PER SQ. YARD DONELSON CONST.  
       (Contractor will provide rubber modified chip seal oil, asphalt distributor 
       and operator, chip spreader and operators; the County shall provide 3/8” chips  
       delivered to our spreader, rollers for compaction, traffic control.) 

BID AWARDED TO B & H PAVING INC. 

 

POLYMER MODIFIED COLD PATCH 

      TON  FOB GUTHRIE DELIVERED 
         99.75/ton  128.00   MIN. 25 TONS                           LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 
         10.00/50# BAG 12.00  50# BAG-MIN. 50 BAGS LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

BID AWARDED TO LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT                                  

 

HOT MIX COLD LAY TON  

90.00                                                             HWY CONTRACTORS  

BID AWARDED TO HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS 

 

HAULING (Rock, Asphalt & Road Materials) 

 (Bid per T. plus mileage)        1.50 per ton for 1st mile-ea. add’l mile .16 J & R SAND CO 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO  

 

CONCRETE – PER YARD NO BID           

  

FINISH CONCRETE ON BRIDGE DECK 

(Bid Labor per Sq. Ft.) 2.25 K & O CONSTRUCTION  

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 
MC 70 GAL. 3.284 ASPHALT & FUEL  
MC 70 GAL. 3.40 + $.00133 Environmental Fee ERGON ASPHALT 

BID AWARDED TO ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY 

 

MC 800 GAL. 3.134 ASPHALT & FUEL  
MC 800 GAL. 3.17 + $.00133 Environmental Fee ERGON ASPHALT 

BID AWARDED TO ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY  

 

MC 3000 GAL.                 3.084 ASPHALT & FUEL  
MC 3000 GAL.  3.12 + $.00133 Environmental Fee ERGON ASPHALT 

BID AWARDED TO ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY 

 

EMULSION – CRS – 2      GAL. 2.34 VANCE BROS. INC.  
EMULSION – CRS – 2      GAL. 2.26 + $.00133 Environmental Fee ERGON ASPHALT  

BID AWARDED TO ERGON ASPHALT 

 

EMULSION – CRS – 2 +     GAL.    2.64  VANCE BROS. INC. 
EMULSION – CRS – 2 +     GAL.    2.56 + $.00133 Environmental Fee ERGON ASPHALT 

BID AWARDED TO ERGON ASPHALT 

 

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY – PUMP CHARGE $75.00 IF REQUIRED 
DEMURRAGE CHARGE $75.00/HR AFTER TWO FREE HRS. 

 

ERGON ASPHALT – PUMP CHARGE $70.00 
DEMURRAGE CHARGE $70.00/HR 2 FREE HOURS 
MINIMUM LOAD 47,000 LBS. 
 
VANCE BROTHERS – PUMP CHARGE $75.00 
DEMURRAGE CHARGE $70.00/HR 2 FREE HOURS 
MINIMUM LOAD 24 TONS 
 

HIGHWAY CENTER STRIPING     

                                          PER FT.    $.15 ARKANSAS SIGN 

BID AWARDED TO ARKANSAS SIGN  

 

PILE  L.F. 

HP 10X42  21.54 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
HP 10X42  24.78 BRIDGE & HWY HP 
10X42  22.90 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
HP 10X42  22.49 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 
HP 12X53          NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
HP 12X53          34.45 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
HP 12X53          29.68 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 



8” X 1/2”  Wall Pipe  NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 
8” X 1/2”  Wall Pipe  21.50 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 
10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  19.90 RAILROAD YARD 
10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 
10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 

10” X 1/2” Wall Pipe  NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 
10” X 1/2” Wall Pipe  23.50 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 
 

PILE DRIVING  
HP 10X42            14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
HP 10X42  25.00 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION  

HP 12X53          14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
HP 12X53  28.00 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION  

8” X 1/2” Wall Pipe  14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
8” X 1/2” Wall Pipe  25.00 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION  

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  25.00 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION  

10” X 1/2” Wall Pipe  14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
10” X 1/2” Wall Pipe  25.00 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION  

 

SRUCTURAL STEEL (I&H Beams) A-36 

New         Per lb.  .5150 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
New         Per lb.  NO BID BRIDGE & HWY 
MATERIALS 
New         Per lb.  .585 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
New         Per lb.  .579 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

Used         Per lb.  .3600 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
Used         Per lb.  NO BID BRIDGE & HWY.  
Used         Per lb.  .329 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
Used         Per lb.  .3245 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 

 

SRUCTURAL STEEL (Angles & Channels) A-36 

New         Per lb.    .5795 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
New         Per lb.    NO BID BRIDGE & HWY 
MATERIALS 
New         Per lb.    .585 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
New         Per lb.    .579 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD  

Used         Per lb.  NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 
Used         Per lb.  .35 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 

 

CABLE STEEL CENTER               Per Ft. 

3/8”    1.89 K & O CONSTRUCTION  
1/2”  2.47 K & O CONSTRUCTION  
5/8”  3.19 K & O CONSTRUCTION  
3/4”  4.10 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION  
 

18” GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.52 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 
12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.56 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 5.68 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID K & O CONSTRUCTION 
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 5.72 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

 

21.7” GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.46 BRIDGE & HWY  
12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.41 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 5.62 BRIDGE & HWY  
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 5.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION  



 

2’ WIDE GALVANIZED STEEL BRIDGE PLANKS 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 6.89 BRIDGE & HWY  

BID AWARDED TO BRIDGE & HWY MATERIALS 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft.  8.74 BRIDGE & HWY.  

BID AWARDED TO BRIDGE & HWY MATERIALS 

 

REBAR GRADE 60  Per Ft. 

1/2”   .34 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  
1/2”   .32 RAILROAD YARD  
1/2”   .32 K & O CONSTRUCTION  

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD & K & O CONSTRUCTION 

5/8”  .525 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
5/8”  .495 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
5/8”  .494 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 
 

CRANE RENTAL 

      15 Ton Minimum   Per Hour 180.00 RAILROAD YARD 
      15 Ton Minimum   Per Hour 170.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

TRACKHOE  

 Per hour 125.00 RAILROAD YARD 
 Per hour 125.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION & RAILROAD YARD 

 
FORKLIFT Per Hour 50.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
FORKLIFT Per Hour 50.00 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION & RAILROAD YARD 
 

GUARD RAILING  Per Ft. 

New  8.24 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
New  NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

Used  3.25 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
Used  2.95 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
Used  3.20 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

STAY INPLACE FORMING Sq. Ft. 

22 Gauge  1.34 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
22 Gauge  1.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION  
22 Gauge  1.24 RAILROAD YARD  

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 

24 Gauge  1.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
24 Gauge  NO BID RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION  
 

OKLAHOMA CERTIFIED STRUCTURAL WELDING 

                                Per Hour 70.00 RAILROAD YARD  
 Per Hour 70.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION & RAILROAD YARD 

                                     

Roundup 

2.5 Gallon  NO BID  
30 Gallon  NO BID  
Bulk  NO BID   

 

Amine 2-4D   
2.5 Gallon  NO BID  
30 Gallon  NO BID  
Bulk  NO BID  

 

Banvel   
2.5  Gallon  NO BID  
30 Gallon  NO BID  
Bulk  NO BID  

 

Ally (Metsulfuron) 
2.5 Gallon  NO BID  
30 Gallon  NO BID  
Bulk  NO BID    

Surfactant   

2.5 Gallon  NO BID  
30 Gallon  NO BID  
Bulk  NO BID   



Liquid Ammonia Sulfate 

2.5 Gallon  NO BID  
30 Gallon  NO BID  
Bulk  NO BID   

 

 LV6 2-4-D                                    

2.5 Gallon  NO BID  
30 Gallon  NO BID  
Bulk  NO BID  

 

CROP OIL                     
2.5 Gallon  NO BID  
30 Gallon  NO BID  
Bulk  NO BID  
 
Dry Ammonia Sulfate per lb. NO BID  

 

GRADER RADIAL TIRES 

1400 x 24                                            950.00                                        HERCULES TIRE SALES 
1400 x 24 NO BID CLINGAN TIRES 
1400 x 24 830.00 SOUTHERN TIRE MART 
1400 x 24 890.00 K & S TIRE INC  

BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART 

 

TRUCK RADIAL TIRES 

1100 x 22.5       HIGHWAY             379.00              HERCULES TIRE SALES 
1100 x 22.5                                        277.00                                          K & S TIRE INC 
1100 x 22.5                                        NO BID               CLINGAN TIRES 
1100 x 22.5    284.00              SOUTHERN TIRE MART  

BID AWARDED TO K & S TIRE INC 

1100 x 22.5       STEERING              382.00                                           HERCULES TIRE SALES 
1100 x 22.5                                        357.00                                           K & S TIRE INC 
1100 x 22.5                                        NO BID                             CLINGAN TIRES 
1100 x 22.5     284.00                                          SOUTHERN TIRE MART 

BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART                                 
1100 x 24.5       HIGHWAY              385.00                                            HERCULES TIRE SALES 
1100 x 24.5                                        298.00                                            K & S TIRE INC 
1100 x 24.5                                        NO BID                                          CLINGAN TIRES 
1100 x 24.5     305.00                 SOUTHERN TIRE MART 

BID AWARDED TO K & S TIRE INC 

1100 x 24.5       STEERING              412.00                                            HERCULES TIRE SALES 
1100 x 24.5                                         386.00                                           K & S TIRE INC 
1100 x 24.5                                         NO BID                                        CLINGAN TIRES 
1100 x 24.5      305.00                SOUTHERN TIRE MART 

BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART                           
 

TRACTOR TIRES 

18.4 R 38                                            1,299.00                                       HERCULES TIRE SALES                                                        
18.4 R 38                                            1,350.00                                       K & S TIRE INC 
18.4 R 38     1,385.00              SOUTHERN TIRE MART 

BID AWARDED TO HERCULES TIRE SALES  

14.9 R 28                                                775.00                                      HERCULES TIRE SALES 
14.9 R 28                                             1,195.00                                      K & S TIRE INC 
14.9 R 28      1,367.00              SOUTHERN TIRE MART 

BID AWARDED TO HERCULES TIRE SALES                                                                                                                    
 

GRADER BLADES                          PER FT. 

5/8 X 6   (WITH 5/8 HOLES)                   8.42                              DUB ROSS 
             8.25                              KIRBY SMITH 
                                                                 11.44                   YELLOWHOUSE MACHINERY 
                   NO BID                         WARREN CAT 

BID AWARDED TO KIRBY SMITH 

5/8 X 8    (WITH 5/8 HOLES)                 11.62                             KIRBY SMITH 
11.85     DUB ROSS 
16.90     YELLOWHOUSE MACHINERY 

                                                                   NO BID                       WARREN CAT 

BID AWARDED TO KIRBY SMITH 

5/8 X 6    (WITH 3/4 HOLES)                   8.25                             KIRBY SMITH 
8.42      DUB ROSS 

                                                                    NO BID                       WARREN CAT 

BID AWARDED TO KIRBY SMITH 

 

5/8 X 8    (WITH 3/4 HOLES)                  11.62                             KIRBY SMITH 
             11.85      DUB ROSS 

         NO BID                         WARREN CAT 

BID AWARDED TO KIRBY SMITH 

 



Motion was made by King and seconded by Rose to approve an Application for Road Crossing from DCP 
Midstream, LP between Sections 9 & 16-3N-22ECM.  Motion carried with all members voting aye.   
 
Motion was made by King and seconded by Raven to approve the monthly reports for the County Clerk, 
Health Dept., Treasurer’s Mortgage Tax, Treasurer’s Report of Officers, Court Clerk, Free Fair (July 2011 
through November 2011) and Library.  Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
 
Motion was made by Raven and seconded by King to approve a Transfer of Appropriations from 
Emergency Management Account Cash-65D to Emergency Management Account Cash-65B in the amount 
of $750.00.  Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
 
Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Raven to deposit the following checks in the Treasurer’s 
Office.  Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
     DCP Midstream, LP (Road Crossing, Dist. #3)----------------------Rec.#482-------$500.00 
     State of Oklahoma (Election Board Salary Reimbursement)------Rec. #484-----$2,494.08 
     State of Oklahoma (DHS Rent)----------------------------------------Rec. #485-------$300.00 
 
Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Raven to pay the following claims. Motion carried with all 
members voting aye. 

WAR#      ISSUED TO:                                       AMOUNT   REASON ISSUED: 

SHERIFF  
 1139 PUGHS OTASCO INC.    $107.01 REPAIRS 
 1140 BEAVER AUTO SUPPLY INC. $121.53 REPAIRS 
 1141 BEAVER AUTO SUPPLY INC. $15.95 REPAIRS 
 1142 AUTO BATH   $23.00 CARWASH 
 1143 COLVIN MILLS AGENCY INC. $330.00 PLAT MAPS 
 1144 SOS LEASING    $143.50 COPIER LEASE 

OSU EXTENSION  
 1145 DOWNINGS MARKET $49.88 SUPPLIES 

COUNTY CLERK  
 1146 SOUTHERN OFFICE SUPPLY $194.29 SUPPLIES 
 1147 STANFIELD PRINTING CO. INC.  $110.54 SUPPLIES 

ASSESSOR  
 1148 STANFIELD PRINTING CO. INC.  $110.93 SUPPLIES 

GENERAL GOV  
 1149 HERALD DEMOCRAT $30.00 PUBLICATION 

FORGAN SR. CITIZENS  
 1150 TOWN OF FORGAN  $64.90 UTILITIES 

BEAVER SR. CITIZENS  
 1151 DOWNINGS MARKET $645.98 SUPPLIES 
 1152 WEST TEXAS GAS INC.  $192.51 UTILITIES 

TURPIN SR. CITIZENS  
 1153 SEWARD COUNTY LANDFILL $49.95 TRASH SERVICE 
 1154 ALLEGIANCE COMMUNICATIONS $56.56 MONTHLY SERVICE 

SLAPOUT FIRE DEPT.  
 1155 NORTHWESTERN ELECTRIC COOP.  *$58.05 UTILITIES 

TRANSIT BUS  
 1156 PANHANDLE MOTOR CO.   $538.91 BRAKE REPAIRS 

JONES & PLUMMER MUSEUM  
 1157 WEST TEXAS GAS INC.  $215.55 UTILITIES 

EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT  
 1158 G & G ELECTRONICS INC. $75.00 BATTERIES 

FREE FAIR  
 1159 PUGHS OTASCO INC.    $66.98 SUPPLIES 
 1160 DOWNINGS MARKET $25.15 SUPPLIES 
 1161 BEAVER SUPPLY LLC $110.84 SUPPLIES 

LIBRARY SALES TAX  
 1162 SOUTHERN OFFICE SUPPLY $178.84 FAX MACHINE 

HEALTH DEPT.  
 1163 WOODWARD CO. HEALTH DEPT. $23.80 SUPPLIES 
 1164 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $30.33 PHONE SERVICE 
 1165 PIONEER ENID CELLULAR  $38.45 CELL SERVICE 

HIGHWAY DIST. #1 

 1003 JO ANN OVERTON $318.50 GRAVEL 
 1004 SHARON KAY KEEL ESTATE $318.50 GRAVEL 
 1005 PANHANDLE EMPLOYERS  $72.50 DRUG TESTING 
 1006 HARPER SANITATION SERVICES $58.63 TRASH SERVICE 
 1007 BEAVER LUMBER COMPANY $30.98 SUPPLIES 
 1008 JAMES LAW $236.60 GRAVEL 
 1009 HERMAN LAW  $234.00 GRAVEL 
 1010 TWANDA MILLER  $234.00 GRAVEL 
 1011 BEAVER AUTO SUPPLY INC. $89.84 PARTS 
 1012 CERTIFIED LABORATORIES  $879.22 GREASE 
 1013 SOUTHWEST KLEENPOWER INC  $2,388.15 OIL TREATMENT 
 1014 BANK OF BEAVER $2,181.60 LEASE PURCHASE 
 1015 HERALD DEMOCRAT $15.00 PUBLICATION 
 1016 NORTHWESTERN ELECTRIC COOP.  $392.39 UTILITIES 



WAR#      ISSUED TO:                                       AMOUNT   REASON ISSUED: 

 1017 TOWN OF GATE  $17.00 TRASH 
 1018 RURAL WATER DIST. #2  $19.50 UTILITIES 

HIGHWAY DIST. #2  
 1019 BEAVER AUTO SUPPLY INC. $1,517.05 PARTS 
 1020 BEAVER LUMBER COMPANY $66.22 PARTS & SUPPLIES 
 1021 BEAVER SUPPLY LLC $10.48 SUPPLIES 
 1022 HERALD DEMOCRAT $15.00 PUBLICATION 
 1023 FIRST SECURITY BANK $4,761.49 LEASE PURCHASE 
 1024 O.P.E.R.S. $5,710.82 BENEFIT/C. D. MARSHALL 
 1047 FIRST SECURITY BANK $3,135.51 LEASE PURCHASE 

HIGHWAY DIST. #3  
 1025 PANHANDLE EMPLOYERS  $72.50 DRUG TESTING 
 1026 WARREN CAT $3,788.50 GRADER BLADES 
 1027 MOTOR PARTS OF PERRYTON $247.70 SUPPLIES 
 1028 AIRGAS MIDSOUTH INC.  $374.69 SUPPLIES 
 1029 POWERPLAN $4,609.38 REPAIRS 
 1030 MOTOR PARTS OF PERRYTON $2,395.01 PARTS 
 1031 SAFETY-KLEEN CORP. $99.00 SERVICE 
 1032 PERRYTON OFFICE SUPPLY    $11.44 OFFICE SUPPLIES 
 1033 PERRYTON OFFICE SUPPLY    $177.32 OFFICE SUPPLIES 
 1034 CIRCUIT ENGINEERING DIST. #8 $200.00 TRAFFIC SIGNS 
 1035 HERCULES TIRE SALES INC.  $10,800.00 GRADER TIRES 
 1036 SCHAEFFER MFG. CO. $427.20 STICK GREASE 
 1037 GUYMON TIRE & AUTO $1,616.63 BACKHOE TIRES 
 1038 HERALD DEMOCRAT $15.00 PUBLICATION 
 1039 UNIFIRST CORPORATION $886.20 UNIFORMS 
 1040 OVERHEAD DOOR CO.  $366.00 DOOR PANEL 
 1041 HERCULES TIRE SALES INC.  $10,990.80 GRADER TIRES 
 1042 SEWARD COUNTY LANDFILL $49.95 SERVICE 
 1043 PERRYTON OFFICE SUPPLY    $284.46 OFFICE SUPPLIES 
 1044 RURAL WATER DISTRICT NO. 1 $19.90 UTILITIES 
 1045 PERRYTON GLASS AND TILE $382.41 WINDSHIELD 
 1046 PERRYTON OFFICE SUPPLY    $139.98 WALKIE TALKIE'S 

RESALE 

 21 KELLPRO INC. $129.00 MAINTENANCE 

SHERIFF CASH 

 152 CHRYSLER CORNER INC.  $930.40 REPAIRS  
 153 BEAVER FEED $23.25 DRUG DOGS FOOD 
 154 DOWNINGS MARKET $357.99 SUPPLIES 
 155 BEAVER SUPPLY LLC $68.48 SUPPLIES 
 156 BEAVER AUTO SUPPLY INC. $364.57 EQUIPMENT 

SHERIFF COMMISSARY CASH 

 15 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION $5.05 SALES TAX 
 16 OKLA. TAX COMMISSION $2.91 PREPAID WIRELESS TAX 

TREASURER CASH 

 5 STANFIELD PRINTING CO. INC.  $313.36 SUPPLIES 
 
  
There being no other business to come before the board at this time, the board adjourned, Voting; Rose aye, 
King aye and Raven aye. 
  
 
_________________________________                      
C. J. Rose, Chairman                                                      
                                                                                      
 
_________________________________ 
Brad Raven, Member 
                                                                                      Attest: 
                                                                                      ____________________________________ 
_________________________________                    Tammy Millikan, County Clerk 
Frank King, Member                                                    Secretary, Board of County Commissioners 
 
 
  
 
 
  


