
Beaver County, Oklahoma 
County Commissioners Proceedings 
January 7, 2008 
 
The Board of County Commissioners met in regular session at 9:00 a.m. in the Office of the County Commissioners on January 7, 2008. 
Notice of the meeting was posted for public information on January 3, 2008 at 4:00 p.m. at all three entrances to the Beaver County 
Courthouse and www.beaver.okcounties.org. 
 
The meeting was called to order by Raven.  Those present were Brad Raven, Chairman; C. J. Rose, Acting Commissioner; Richard Cowan, 
Member, Karen Schell, County Clerk/Secretary, Alan Foster, Denise Janko, Sharon Raven, Mechille Calhoun, Vera Floyd and Reuben 
Parker, Jr.  
 
Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Cowan to approve the minutes of the December 31, 2007 meeting.  Motion carried with all 
members voting aye. 
 
Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Raven to deposit the following checks in the Treasurer’s Office. Motion carried with all 
members voting aye. 
      Check--------------St of Ok (reimbursement for Election Board salary)-----------Rec. #10156------------$2,550.12 
 
Motion was made by Cowan and seconded by Rose to approve the monthly reports for the Election Board, Library, County Clerk and Court 
Clerk. Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
 
Motion was made by Rose and seconded by Raven to approve a Resolution to call a Fair Board Election. Filing period shall be from January 
28, 2008 through February 1, 2008.  Election shall be held on February 11, 2008 from 1:30 to 2:30 p.m. in the Office of the County 
Commissioners. Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
 
Commissioners performed the annual jail inspection. 
 
Motion was made by Cowan and seconded by Rose to appoint Brad Raven as Chairman of the County Commissioners for 2008. Motion 
carried with all members voting aye. 
 
9:40 A.M. a motion was made by Cowan and seconded by Raven to go into executive session pursuant to Title 25 § 307 with Alan Foster 
Assistant District Attorney for litigation discussion concerning Cimarron Gathering lawsuit. Motion was made by Cowan and seconded by 
Raven to adjourn executive session at 9:50 A.M.  Motion was made at 9:51 A.M. by Cowan and seconded by Raven to return to regular 
session.  Motion was made by Cowan and seconded by Raven to allow the District Attorney to settle the lawsuit with Cimarron Gathering at 
no less than $2.25 per foot. Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
 
10:00 county officer meeting was held. Sharon Raven said everything was going fine in her office. Mechille Calhoun said that Evelyn Nelson 
would be retiring on the 31st and they would be having a retirement party for her on the 30th. Mechille said she was very proud of her 
employees for all their hard work during this tax season and that they have collected 2 million already. Mechille said she is looking for a 
replacement at this time for Evelyn. Denis Janko said that things are like they normally are at the Library. Vera Floyd said that February 5th is 
the big election and the last day to change your voter registration is Friday. Cowan asked who all would be closing for the funeral. Court 
Clerk said her office was and the Assessor’s Office was and the Treasurer didn’t know for sure. Vera Floyd said that she had training on 
Tuesday morning and wondered if anyone had someone that could keep her office open for her. No one had any suggestions. Brad Raven 
wanted to let everyone know that there were no bids on the courthouse building but we would go out for bids again in 6 months or so. 
 
11:00 6 month bid opening was held. Motion was made by Cowan and seconded by Rose to accept the bids as follows. Motion carried with 
all members voting aye. 
 

2  2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE  

                                   16 GA.               
18”   10.42 DUB ROSS                 
18”   12.12 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
24”   14.16 DUB ROSS   
24”                             15.25 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

30”   18.00 DUB ROSS   
30”   18.74 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

36”   20.00 DUB ROSS   
36”   23.86 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

48” 29.91 DUB ROSS 
48”                             31.67         K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

60” 40.92 DUB ROSS 
60”   43.24 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
72” 60.50 DUB ROSS   
72” 61.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

  
96” NO BID DUB ROSS 
96” 84.80 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

   
 



120” NO BID DUB ROSS 
120” 175.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

   
144” NO BID DUB ROSS 
144” 229.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION   
 

2  2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE  

                                   14 GA.               
18”   13.95 DUB ROSS                   
18”   14.95 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
24”   18.14 DUB ROSS 
24”   19.10 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
30”   22.81 DUB ROSS   
30”   23.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
36”   27.90 DUB ROSS   
36”   28.90 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 
 
48”                             36.27 DUB ROSS        
48”                             38.25 K & O CONSTRUCTION        

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
60”   48.97 DUB ROSS   
60”   52.38 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
72” 71.00 DUB ROSS 
72” 72.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

    
96” 100.00 DUB ROSS 
96”   99.99 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

    
120” NO BID DUB ROSS 
120” 195.75 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

    
144” NO BID DUB ROSS 
144” 240.95 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION   
  

3” X 1” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE 

 
58” X 36”   14 GA.  42.27 DUB ROSS   
58” X 36”   14 GA.  44.66 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 
 
65” X 40”   14 GA. 51.17 DUB ROSS   
65” X 40”   14 GA. 53.14 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
72” X 44”  14 GA. 58.90 DUB ROSS   
72” X 44”  14 GA. 59.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
73” X 55”  14 GA. 64.00 DUB ROSS   
73” X 55”  14 GA. 66.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 
 
81” X 59”  14 GA. 69.95 DUB ROSS   
81” X 59”  14 GA. 72.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
87” X 63”  14 GA. 78.00 DUB ROSS 
87” X 63”  14 GA. 80.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION   

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
95” X 66”  12 GA.  110.00 DUB ROSS 
95” X 66”  12 GA. 113.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION   

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

 

 

 

 



2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE 

 16 GA.  
18” 9.67 DUB ROSS 
18” 11.12 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
24” 12.82 DUB ROSS  
24” 14.25 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
30” 15.95 DUB ROSS  
30” 17.74 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
36” 19.35 DUB ROSS   
36” 21.96 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
48” 28.55 DUB ROSS   
48” 29.20 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
60” 36.72 DUB ROSS 
60” 39.86 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
72” 43.95 DUB ROSS 
72” 56.67 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

    
96” 75.00 DUB ROSS 
96” 78.11 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

   
120” NO BID DUB ROSS 
120” 145.75 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

   
144” NO BID DUB ROSS 
144” 200.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE 

 14 GA.  
18” 12.75 DUB ROSS   
18” 13.45 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
24” 16.99 DUB ROSS   
24” 17.64 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
30” 20.95 DUB ROSS   
30” 21.95 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
36” 25.62 DUB ROSS   
36” 26.27 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

48” 34.27 DUB ROSS   
48” 35.27 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
60” 47.50 DUB ROSS   
60” 48.28 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
72” 65.90 DUB ROSS 
72” 66.88 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

  
96” 92.37 DUB ROSS 
96” 93.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

    
120” 135.00 DUB ROSS 
120” 150.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

  
144” 220.00 DUB ROSS 
144” 240.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 



3” X 1” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE 

60”     16 GA. 41.15 DUB ROSS   
60”     16 GA. 46.47  K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
66”     16 GA. 49.17 DUB ROSS   
66”     16 GA. 51.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
72”     16 GA. 55.00 DUB ROSS   
72”     16 GA. 56.67 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
78”     16 GA. 60.00 DUB ROSS   
78”     16 GA. 61.70 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

84”     14 GA. 78.37 DUB ROSS   
84”     14 GA. 80.10 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
90”     14 GA. 78.72 DUB ROSS   
90”     14 GA. 86.95 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
96”     14 GA. 83.90 DUB ROSS   
96”     14 GA. 93.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

   
102”   14 GA.   90.25 DUB ROSS 
102”   14 GA. 103.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
108”   12 GA. 128.00 DUB ROSS   
108”   12 GA. 138.85 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
114”   12 GA. 137.81 DUB ROSS   
114”   12 GA. 147.81 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 
120”   12 GA. 146.00 DUB ROSS   
120”   12 GA.            156.86 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS 

 

CHIPS  TON 

1/2”   15.00 J & R SAND CO 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND  CO 

 
3/8”     7.10 DOLESE BROS. CO 

BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

 
5/8”     6.90 DOLESE BROS. CO 

BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

 

SCREENED ROCK                          TON 

3 /4”                                                     NO BID     
                                                                
1 ¼”                                                      15.00 J & R SAND CO 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND 

 
3 /4”  Crusher Run                               4.60 DOLESE BROS. CO 

BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROS. CO 

 

 ASPHALT TYPE B&D      TON 

  55.00   (NO LAY DOWN MACHINE) J & R SAND CO 
  65.00   (NO LAY DOWN MACHINE) HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO  

  60.00   (WITH LAY DOWN MACHINE) J & R SAND CO 
                                                            70.00    (WITH LAY DOWN MACHINE)  HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND  

 

TACK COAT  GAL.  

     (applied)  2.50 J & R SAND CO 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO  

 

CRACK SEALING (applied) .785 LB. B & H PAVING INC. 
                                                             1.54  LB. TRI CITY SEAL 

BID AWARDED TO B & H PAVING INC. 

 

 

 

 

 



CHIP SEALING       PER MILE   

        1,400.00 B & H PAVING INC 
                                                             3,750.00 MMS CONSTRUCTION  
       (Contractor to furnish all labor & equipment. The county will be responsible for providing 
        rock & oil within 5 miles of job site.) 

BID AWARDED TO B & H PAVING INC. 

 

POLYMER MODIFIED COLD PATCH 

      TON  FOB GUTHRIE DELIVERED 
         75.00  99.00 MIN. 25 TONS                            LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT 
         7.00 50# BAG  8.25 MIN. 50 BAGS 

BID AWARDED TO LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT                                  

 

HOT MIX  COLD LAY TON  

72.50     HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS  

BID AWARDED TO HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS 

 

TRUCKING 

(Bid per T. plus mileage)        1.25 per ton for 1st mile-ea. add’l mile .15 J & R SAND CO 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO 

 

CLASS AA CONCRETE FOR BRIDGE DECKS 

(Bid per Yd. plus mileage) NO BID _____________________ 

 

FINISH CONCRETE ON BRIDGE DECK 

(Bid Labor per Sq. Ft.) 1.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

MC 800 GAL. 2.223 GARY WILLIAMS ENERGY  
MC 800 GAL. 2.14 SEMMATERIALS LP 

BID AWARDED TO SEMMATERIALS  

 

EMULSION – CRS – 2      GAL. 1.42 SEMMATERIALS LP 

BID AWARDED TO SEMMATERIALS LP 

 

HIGHWAY CENTER STRIPING     

                                          PER FT.    .135 TIME STRIPING 

BID AWARDED TO TIME STRIPING  

    

PILE  L.F. 

HP 10X42            21.63 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
HP 10X42  21.95 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY 
HP 10X42  24.40 BRIDGE & HWY MATERIALS 
HP 10X42  22.24 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 
HP 12X53          27.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
HP 12X53  27.80 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY 
HP 12X53  33.35 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 
8” X 1/2”  Wall Pipe  22.75 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  16.50 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY 

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY  
 
10” X 1/2”  Wall Pipe 18.95 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD  
 

PILE DRIVING  
HP 10X42            14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
HP 12X53          14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
8” X 1/2”  Wall Pipe  14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
10” X 3/8”  Wall Pipe 14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
10” X 1/2”  Wall Pipe 14.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

SRUCTURAL STEEL (I&H Beams) A-36 

New         Per lb.  .527 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
New         Per lb.  .5290 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY  
New         Per lb.  .633 BRIDGE & HWY MATERIALS 
New         Per lb.  .55 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 
Used         Per lb.  .26 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
Used         Per lb.  .2250 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY 
Used         Per lb.  .234 BRIDGE & HWY. MATERIALS 
Used         Per lb.  .2195 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 

 

 

 

 



STRUCTURAL STEEL (Angles & Channels) A-36 

New         Per lb.  .52 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
New         Per lb.  .5290 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY 
New         Per lb.    .5290 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION  

 
Used         Per lb.  .26 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
Used         Per lb.  .28 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

USED PIPE 

2 7/8”        Per lb.  NO BID  
8”              Per lb.  NO BID   

CABLE STEEL CENTER               Per Ft. 

3/8”    1.20 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
1/2”  1.30 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
5/8”  1.75 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
3/4”  2.55 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

18” GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.50 K & O CONSTRUCTION  
12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.29 SUNBELT EQUIIP. & SUPPLY 
12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.30 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY 

 
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 5.40 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY 

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY 

 

21.7” GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.35 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.35 BRIDGE & HWY MATERIALS 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION & BRIDGE & HWY MATERIALS 

 
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 6.9 BRIDGE & HWY MATERIALS 

BID AWARDED TO BRIDGE & HWY. MATERIALS  
 

2’ WIDE GALVANIZED STEEL BRIDGE PLANKS 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 6.10 BRIDGE & HWY. MATERIALS 

BID AWARDED TO BRIDGE & HWY. MATERIALS 

 
10 Gauge Sq. Ft.  7.95 BRIDGE & HWY. MATERIALS 

 BID AWARDED TO BRIDGE & HWY MATERIALS 

 

REBAR GRADE 60  Per Ft. 

1/2”   .28 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
1/2”  .27 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY 
1/2”  .29 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY 

 
5/8”  .45 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
5/8”  .44 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY  
5/8”  .46 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY   
 

CRANE RENTAL 

      15 Ton Minimum   Per Hour 165.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

      BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 
TRACKHOE Per hour 125.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

FORKLIFT Per Hour 60.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

GUARD RAILING  Per Ft. 

New  8.55 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
New  8.45 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY 

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY 

 
Used  4.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION 
Used  3.25 SUNBELT EQUIIP. & SUPPLY 
Used  3.25 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY & RAILROAD YARD 

 

STAY INPLACE FORMING Sq. Ft. 

22 Gauge  1.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION  
22 Gauge    .89 SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY 
22 Gauge    .85 RAILROAD YARD 

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD 

 
24 Gauge  1.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION  

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 



OKLAHOMA CERTIFIED STRUCTURAL WELDING 

                                Per Hour 65.00 K & O CONSTRUCTION  
                                   Helper 27.00  

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION 

 

No Bid Received for the following:    

Roundup     

Amine 2-4D     

Banvel    

Ally    

Surfactant    

Liquid Ammonia Sulfate   

Dry Ammonia Sulfate   

Motion was made by Cowan and seconded by Raven to pay the following claims. Motion carried with all members voting aye. 
 WAR# ISSUED TO: AMOUNT REASON ISSUED: 
 5 ROMAN NOSE STATE PARK $240.85 ROOM & MEALS 
        18   G & G ELECTRONICS INC.                                       $1,690.00     RADIO EQUIPMENT 
 19 CAMERA GALLERY INC. $148.35 BINOCULARS 
 20 PUGHS OTASCO INC.    $44.99 TELEPHONE/ANSWERING MACHINE 
    1144   BOSTONS SERVICE                                                    $25.85     FUEL 
 1145 AUTO BATH   $30.00 CAR WASH 
 1146 PANHANDLE MOTOR CO.   $170.98 PARTS & REPAIRS 
 1147 BEAVER AUTO SUPPLY INC. $21.19 REPAIRS 
 1148 SOUND SERVICE/RADIO SHACK $536.97 SUPPLIES 
 1149 G T DISTRIBUTORS INC. $623.05 TASER SUPPLIES 
 1150 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $72.92 PHONE SERVICE 
 1151 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $12.70 PHONE SERVICE 
 1152 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $17.11 PHONE SERVICE 
 1153 SOUTHERN OFFICE SUPPLY $313.85 SUPPLIES 
 1154 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $25.05 PHONE SERVICE 
 1155 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $26.65 PHONE SERVICE 
 1156 PITNEY BOWES INC.   $279.71 POSTAGE METER INK CARTRIDGE 
 1157 WEST TEXAS GAS INC.  $707.39 UTILITIES 
 1158 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $3.24 PHONE SERVICE 
 1159 WEST TEXAS GAS INC.  $61.01 UTILITIES 
 1160 TOWN OF FORGAN  $64.74 UTILITIES 
 1161 RURAL WASTE MANAGEMENT INC. $63.93 UTILITIES 
 1162 NORTHWESTERN ELECTRIC COOP.   $43.78 UTILITIES 
 1163 WEST TEXAS GAS INC.  $61.69 UTILITIES 
 1164 SOUTHERN OFFICE SUPPLY $34.38 SUPPLIES 
 1165 G & G ELECTRONICS INC. $40.00 RADIO REPAIR 
 1166 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $30.23 PHONE SERVICE 
 1167 BEAVER SUPPLY LLC $3.99 SUPPLIES 
 1168 WEST TEXAS GAS INC.  $509.82 UTILITIES 
 1169 ESMERALDA MATA-RUIZ $112.52 TRAVEL 
 1170 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $49.66 LONG DISTANCE 
      990    STARR LUMBER CO.                                                    $153.16    SUPPLIES 
 991 PANHANDLE MOTOR CO.   $86.87 PARTS 
 992 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $47.29 PHONE SERVICE 
 993 RURAL WATER DIST. #2  $19.50 UTILITIES 
 994 TOWN OF GATE  $17.00 UTILITIES 
 995 NORTHWESTERN ELECTRIC COOP.   $342.28 UTILITIES 
 996 PANHANDLE NATURAL GAS INC.  $48.69 UTILITIES 
 997 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $18.04 PHONE SERVICE 
 998 WEST TEXAS GAS INC.  $17.71 UTILITIES 
 999 BANK OF BEAVER $1,774.86 LEASE PURCHASE 
 1000 BANK OF BEAVER $3,420.01 LEASE PURCHASE 
 1001 BANK OF BEAVER $3,420.01 LEASE PURCHASE 
 1002 FIRST SECURITY BANK $3,820.73 LEASE PURCHASE 
 1003 FIRST SECURITY BANK $5,001.92 LEASE PURCHASE 
 1004 BARTLETTS ACE HARDWARE $13.99 SUPPLIES 
 1005 PANHANDLE EMPLOYERS SERVICES $162.50 TESTING 
 1006 WELDON PARTS INC. $847.24 PARTS 
 1007 NATS  $3,946.99 REPAIRS 
 1008 SAFETY-KLEEN CORP. $99.00 SERVICE 
 1009 WELDON PARTS INC. $588.69 PARTS 
 1010 HOLIDAY INN $81.00 ROOM & MEALS 
 1011 AIRGAS MID SOUTH INC. $445.72 SUPPLIES 
 1012 NTS COMMUNICATIONS INC. $33.76 PHONE SERVICE 
        14    HERALD DEMOCRAT                                         $35.00    SUPPLIES 
 15 SOUTHERN OFFICE SUPPLY $198.12 SUPPLIES 
 16 STANFIELD PRINTING CO. INC.  $92.25 SUPPLIES 
 17 SOUTHERN OFFICE SUPPLY $83.55 SUPPLIES 
         79   CABELAS INC.                                                   $629.71    SURVEILLANCE EQUIPMENT 
 80 JJ S PLUMBING $370.57 REPAIRS 
 81 ZEE SERVICE CO. $92.20 JAIL FIRST AID SUPPLIES 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



There being no other business to come before the board at this time, the board adjourned, Voting; Raven, aye; Rose, aye and Cowan, aye. 
 
 
 _________________________________ 
 Brad Raven, Chairman 
 
Attest: _________________________________ 
 C. J. Rose, Acting Member  
___________________________________ 
Karen Schell, County Clerk _________________________________ 
Secretary, Board of County Commissioners Richard Cowan, Member 
 
 
 
 
 
 


