
16 GA.

18" No Bid

18" 20.70
18" 32.70

24" No Bid
24" 27.70
24" 42.68

30" No Bid
30" 34.94
30" No Bid

36" No Bid
36" No Bid
36" No Bid

14 GA.
18" No Bid
18" 26.62
18" 40.10

24" No Bid
24" 35.28
24" 52.50

* All bids from D.P. Supply Co. were for polyproplene pipe

BID AWARDED TO

Welborn Sales, inc.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

D.P. Supply Co.

BID AWARDED TO

Dub Ross Company, Inc.
D.P. Supply Co.

Welborn Sales, inc.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

D.P. Supply Co.

BID AWARDED TO

BID AWARDED TO

D.P. Supply Co.

Welborn Sales, inc.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

D.P. Supply Co.

2  2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE 

2  2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE 

BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #1 - CULVERTS

TABULATION
October 6, 2025 to April 6, 2026

D.P. Supply Co. *
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

Dub Ross

Dub Ross

Dub Ross

No Bid

Dub Ross

Dub Ross

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO

BID AWARDED TO



30" No Bid
30" 43.92
30" 65.10

36" No Bid
36" 52.54
36" 77.80

14 GA.
53" x 41" No Bid
53" x 41" 83.27
53" x 41" No Bid

60" x 46" No Bid
60" x 46" 92.68
60" x 46" No Bid

66" x 51" No Bid
66" x 51" 104.62
66" x 51" No Bid

73" x 55" No Bid
73" x 55" 115.50
73" x 55" No Bid

81" x 59" No Bid
81" x 59" 124.88
81" x 59" No Bid

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

Dub Ross Company, Inc.
Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

Welborn Sales, inc.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

D.P. Supply Co.

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

BID AWARDED TO

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO

Welborn Sales, inc.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

D.P. Supply Co.

3” X 1” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE

Dub Ross

Dub Ross



87" x 63" No Bid
87" x 63" 132.95
87" x 63" No Bid

12 GA.
95" x 67" No Bid
95" x 67" 142.56
95" x 67" No Bid

16 GA.
18" No Bid
18" 19.35
18" 29.50

24" No Bid
24" 25.80
24" 39.08

30" No Bid
30" 32.50
30" No Bid

36" No Bid
36" 38.57
36" No Bid

48" No Bid
48" 60.50
48" No Bid

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

 2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE



14 GA.
18" No Bid
18" 24.77
18" 36.90

24" No Bid
24" 32.82
24" 48.90

30" No Bid
30" 40.86
30" 60.90

36" No Bid
36" 48.88
36" 72.60

48" No Bid
48" 66.25
48" 96.60

16 GA.
60" No Bid
60" 74.91
60" No Bid

66" No Bid
66" 82.28
66" No Bid

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO

Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

Dub Ross

2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE

3” X 1” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE



72" No Bid
72" 89.66
72" No Bid

78" No Bid
78" 97.00
78" No Bid

14 GA.
84" No Bid
84" 132.62
84" No Bid

90" No Bid
90" 142.06
90" No Bid

96" No Bid
96" 151.35
96" No Bid

12 GA.
102" No Bid
102" 227.58
102" No Bid

108" No Bid
108" 240.84
108" No Bid

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross



114" No Bid
114" 257.40
114" No Bid

120" No Bid
120" 275.09
120" No Bid

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross

D.P. Supply Co.
Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross



TON

1/2" NO BID

1/2" NO BID

1/2" 28.00

TON

3/4" 25.65

3/4" NO BID

3/4" NO BID

TON

3/8" 26.05

3/8" NO BID

3/8" NO BID

TON

7/16" NO BID

7/16" NO BID

7/16" NO BID

TON

5/8" 25.85

5/8" NO BID

5/8" NO BID

BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #2 - ROCK, ASPHALT, TRUCKING, AND CONCRETE

TABULATION
October 6, 2025 to April 6, 2026

CHIPS

Dolese Bros. Co.

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

BID AWARDED TO

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO

BID AWARDED TO

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

J & R Constructors Group

Dolese Bros. Co.

Dolese Bros. Co.

NO BID

Dolese Bros. Co.



TON

1 1/4"" 19.25 (1")

1 1/4" NO BID

1 1/4" 21.00

TON

1 1/2"" 18.40

1 1/2" NO BID

1 1/2" NO BID

TON
*SUPPLY NO BID

LAY DOWN NO BID

MACHINE NO BID

TON
*NO NO BID

LAY DOWN NO BID

MACHINE 110.00

GAL

NO BID

*APPLIED NO BID

NO BID

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO

ASPHALT HOT MIX

Dolese Bros. Co.

SCREENED ROCK

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO

TACK COAT

Dolese Bros. Co.

NO BID

J & R Constructors Group

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO NO BID



TON
PICKED UP

NO BID

126.50

NO BID

TON
DELIVERED

NO BID

205.00/ MIN. 25

NO BID

50lb. BAG
PICKED UP

NO BID

12.50

NO BID

50lb. BAG
DELIVERED

NO BID

15.50/ MIN. 50

NO BID

TON

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO Logan County Asphalt

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

Logan County Asphalt

POLYMER MODIFIED COLD PATCH

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

Logan County Asphalt

BID AWARDED TO

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

Logan County Asphalt

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

BID AWARDED TO

HOT MIX - COLD LAY

Dolese Bros. Co.



*Bid per ton NO BID

plus NO BID

mileage NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

MILEAGE - PER MILE

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

BID AWARDED TO

CONCRETE - PER YARD

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group

NO BID

HAULING (Rock, Asphalt, and Road Material)

Dolese Bros. Co.

Logan County Asphalt

J & R Constructors Group



GAL

MC 70 2.70

MC 70 NO BID

GAL

MC 800 2.58

MC 800 NO BID

GAL

MC 800+ 2.68

MC 800+ NO BID

GAL

EMULSION - CRS - 2 2.44

EMULSION - CRS - 2 2.10

GAL

EMULSION - CRS - 2+ 2.53

EMULSION - CRS - 2+ 2.36

RETURN FREIGHT

Pump Fee: $125.00

Demurrage: $100/hr after 2 free hours
Short Freight: $1,030 for loads less than $5500 gal.

Pump Charge: $150.00
Demurrage: $100.00 per hour, 2 hours free
Minimum Freight: 48,000 lbs.
Federal Environmental Fee: $0.00150/gal.

Ergon Asphalt

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions

BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #3 - ROAD OIL

TABULATION
October 6, 2025 to April 6, 2026

Coastal Energy Corporation

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions

BID AWARDED TO Coastal Energy Corporation

Coastal Energy Corporation

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions

BID AWARDED TO Coastal Energy Corporation

Coastal Energy Corporation

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions

Coastal Energy Corporation

BID AWARDED TO Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions

Coastal Energy

BID AWARDED TO Coastal Energy Corporation

Coastal Energy Corporation

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions

BID AWARDED TO Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions



L.F.

HP 10x42 33.39

HP 10x42 33.56

HP 10x42 NO BID

HP 12x53 43.51

HP 12x53 42.14

HP 12x53 NO BID

10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe 31.74

10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe 29.90

10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe NO BID

HP 10x42 NO BID

HP 10x42 NO BID

HP 10x42 NO BID

HP 12x53 NO BID

HP 12x53 NO BID

HP 12x53 NO BID

BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #4 - BRIDGE MATERIAL

TABULATION
October 6, 2025 to April 6, 2026

PILE

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

The Railroad Yard

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

PILE DRIVING

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO NO BID



10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe NO BID

10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe NO BID

10" X 3/8" Wall Pipe NO BID

Per lb.

New 0.910

New 0.925

New NO BID

Per lb.

Used 0.395

Used 0.46

Used NO BID

Per lb.

New 0.7605

New 0.89

New NO BID

Per lb.

Used NO BID

Used NO BID

Used NO BID

Sq. Ft.

12 Gauge NO BID

12 Gauge NO BID

12 Gauge 16.98 (truckload)

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

STRUCTURAL STEEL (I & H Beams) A-36

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

STRUCTURAL STEEL (Angles & Channels) A-36

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

18" GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Welborn Sales, inc.



Sq. Ft.

10 Gauge NO BID

10 Gauge 8.88

10 Gauge 20.89 (truckload)

Sq. Ft.

12 Gauge 7.58

12 Gauge NO BID

12 Gauge 16.00 (truckload)

Sq. Ft.

10 Gauge 9.30

10 Gauge NO BID

10 Gauge 18.00 (truckload)

Sq. Ft.

12 Gauge 13.37

12 Gauge NO BID

12 Gauge NO BID

Sq. Ft.

10 Gauge 16.52

10 Gauge NO BID

10 Gauge NO BID

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

21.7" GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

2' WIDE GALVANIZED STEEL BRIDGE PLANKS

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard



Per Ft.

1/2" 0.3976

1/2" 0.45

1/2" NO BID

Per Ft.

5/8" 0.6208

5/8" 0.69

5/8" NO BID

15 Ton min. per/hr NO BID

15 Ton min. per/hr NO BID

15 Ton min. per/hr NO BID

Per Hr.

Trackhoe NO BID

Trackhoe NO BID

Trackhoe NO BID

Per Hr.

Forklift NO BID

Forklift NO BID

Forklift NO BID

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

REBAR GRADE 60

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

CRANE RENTAL

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO NO BID



Per Ft.

New 9.84

New NO BID

New 15.50  ($7,500 min)

Per Ft.

Used 3.67

Used NO BID

Used NO BID

Sq. Ft.

22 Gauge 1.65

22 Gauge NO BID

22 Gauge NO BID

Sq. Ft.

24 Gauge NO BID

24 Gauge NO BID

24 Gauge NO BID

Per Hour NO BID

Per Hour NO BID

Per Hour NO BID

GUARDRAILING

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

STAY IN PLACE FORMING

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO The Railroad Yard

OKLAHOMA CERTIFIED STRUCTRUAL WELDING

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

The Railroad Yard

Sunbelt Equipment & Supply

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO NO BID



1400 x 24 875.00

1400 x 24 780.00

1400 x 24 650.00

1400 x 24 950.00

1400 x 24 NO BID

1100 x 22.5 HIGHWAY 275.00

1100 x 22.5 HIGHWAY 231.00

1100 x 22.5 HIGHWAY 235.00

1100 x 22.5 HIGHWAY 235.00

1100 x 22.5 HIGHWAY 706.39

1100 x 22.5 STEERING 275.00

1100 x 22.5 STEERING 231.00

1100 x 22.5 STEERING 235.00

1100 x 22.5 STEERING 235.00

1100 x 22.5 STEERING 643.39

1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON 290.00

1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON 255.00

1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON 245.00

1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON 235.00

1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON 761.92

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart

Tire Dealer Warehouse

T & W Tire

BID AWARDED TO T & W Tire

Welborn Sales, inc.

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart

Tire Dealer Warehouse

T & W Tire

BID AWARDED TO Southern Tire Mart

Welborn Sales, inc.

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart

Tire Dealer Warehouse

T & W Tire

BID AWARDED TO Southern Tire Mart

Welborn Sales, inc.

TRUCK RADIAL TIRES

BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #5 - TIRES

TABULATION
October 6, 2025 to April 6, 2026

GRADER RADIAL TIRES

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart

Tire Dealer Warehouse

T & W Tire

BID AWARDED TO Tire Dealer Warehouse

Welborn Sales, inc.



1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY 280.00

1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY 250.00

1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY 245.00

1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY 250.00

1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY 744.59

1100 x 24.5 STEERING 280.00

1100 x 24.5 STEERING 250.00

1100 x 24.5 STEERING 245.00

1100 x 24.5 STEERING 250.00

1100 x 24.5 STEERING 679.59

1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON 310.00

1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON 275.00

1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON 255.00

1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON 250.00

1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON 755.59

18.4 R 38 1325.00

18.4 R 38 890.00

18.4 R 38 1050.00

18.4 R 38 1200.00

18.4 R 38 NO BID

14.9 R 28 850.00

14.9 R 28 555.00

14.9 R 28 595.00

14.9 R 28 800.00

14.9 R 28 NO BID

Welborn Sales, inc.

Welborn Sales, inc.

T & W Tire

BID AWARDED TO Southern Tire Mart

BID AWARDED TO Southern Tire Mart

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart

Tire Dealer Warehouse

TRACTOR RADIAL TIRES

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart

Tire Dealer Warehouse

T & W Tire

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart

Tire Dealer Warehouse

T & W Tire

BID AWARDED TO T & W Tire

Welborn Sales, inc.

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart

Tire Dealer Warehouse

T & W Tire

BID AWARDED TO Tire Dealer Warehouse

Welborn Sales, inc.

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart

Tire Dealer Warehouse

T & W Tire

BID AWARDED TO Tire Dealer Warehouse

Welborn Sales, inc.



14.9 R 24 685.00

14.9 R 24 465.00

14.9 R 24 495.00

14.9 R 24 700.00

14.9 R 24 NO BID Welborn Sales, inc.

Tire Dealer Warehouse

T & W Tire

BID AWARDED TO Southern Tire Mart

Direct Discount Tire

Southern Tire Mart



5/8 x 6 (5/8 INCH HOLES) 13.20

5/8 x 6 (5/8 INCH HOLES) 15.14

5/8 x 6 (5/8 INCH HOLES) 10.13

5/8 x 6 (5/8 INCH HOLES) 20.28

5/8 x 8 (5/8 INCH HOLES) 18.21

5/8 x 8 (5/8 INCH HOLES) 21.32

5/8 x 8 (5/8 INCH HOLES) 13.93

5/8 x 8 (5/8 INCH HOLES) 25.45

5/8 x 6 (3/4 INCH HOLES) 13.20

5/8 x 6 (3/4 INCH HOLES) 15.14

5/8 x 6 (3/4 INCH HOLES) 18.13

5/8 x 6 (3/4 INCH HOLES) 20.28

5/8 x 8 (3/4 INCH HOLES) 18.21

5/8 x 8 (3/4 INCH HOLES) 21.32

5/8 x 8 (3/4 INCH HOLES) 13.93

5/8 x 8 (3/4 INCH HOLES) 25.45

Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Kirby Smith Machinery, Inc.

Warren Cat

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Warren Cat

Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Kirby Smith Machinery, Inc.

Warren Cat

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Kirby Smith Machinery, Inc.

Warren Cat

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Warren Cat

Dub Ross Company, Inc.

Kirby Smith Machinery, Inc.

Warren Cat

Welborn Sales, inc.

BID AWARDED TO Warren Cat

BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #6 - GRADER BLADES

TABULATION
October 6, 2025 to April 6, 2026

GRADER BLADES


