BEAVER COUNTY ELECTION BALLOT PRINTING BID #3- TABULATION JANUARY 1, 2023 TO DECEMBER 31, 2023

REGULAR BALLOTS

Maximum quantity per elec	ction:	N/AMid-West PrintingN/ARoyal PrintingNo BidTulsa County			
	<u>Unit Price</u>	Additional Cost for <u>Color Distinction</u>			
<u>8.5 x 14.0 inches</u>					
Price per ballot:	\$0.135	<u>\$0.01</u>	Mid-West Printing		
Thee per ballot.	<u>\$0.135</u> \$0.145	<u>\$0.01</u>	Royal Printing		
			•		
	<u>No Bid</u>	<u>No Bid</u>	Tulsa County		
BID AWARDED TO: <u>Royal Printing Company</u>					
<u>8.5 x 17.0 inches</u>					
Price per ballot:	<u>\$0.14</u>	<u>\$0.015</u>	Mid-West Printing		
	<u>\$0.155</u>	<u>\$0.00</u>	Royal Printing		
	No Bid	No Bid	Tulsa County		
BID AWARDED TO: Roya					
		<u></u>			
<u>8.5 x 19.0 inches</u>					
Price per ballot:	\$0.15	<u>\$0.02</u>	Mid-West Printing		
Thee per ballot.			-		
	<u>\$0.155</u>	<u>\$0.00</u>	Royal Printing		
	<u>No Bid</u>	<u>No Bid</u>	Tulsa County		
BID AWARDED TO: <u>Roya</u>	al Printing Compa	ny			
ADSENTEE DALLOTS					
ABSENTEE BALLOTS					
	ction:	N/A Mid-West Printing			
ABSENTEE BALLOTS Maximum quantity per elec	ction:	<u>N/A</u> Mid-West Printing			
	ction:	<u>N/A</u> Royal Printing			
	ction:				
		N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County			
	ction: <u>Unit Price</u>	N/ARoyal PrintingNo BidTulsa CountyAdditional Cost for			
Maximum quantity per elec		N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County			
Maximum quantity per elec <u>8.5 x 14.0 inches</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction			
Maximum quantity per elec	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction §0.01 \$0.01	Mid-West Printing		
Maximum quantity per elec <u>8.5 x 14.0 inches</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction	Mid-West Printing Royal Printing		
Maximum quantity per elec <u>8.5 x 14.0 inches</u>	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction §0.01 \$0.01			
Maximum quantity per elec <u>8.5 x 14.0 inches</u>	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 \$0.00 No Bid	Royal Printing		
Maximum quantity per elec 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot:	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 \$0.00 No Bid	Royal Printing		
Maximum quantity per elec 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: <u>Roya</u>	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 \$0.00 No Bid	Royal Printing		
Maximum quantity per elec <u>8.5 x 14.0 inches</u> Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: <u>Roya</u> <u>8.5 x 17.0 inches</u>	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 No Bid No Bid	Royal Printing Tulsa County		
Maximum quantity per elec 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: <u>Roya</u>	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.14</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for <u>Color Distinction</u> <u>\$0.01</u> <u>\$0.00</u> No Bid my <u>\$0.015</u>	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing		
Maximum quantity per elec <u>8.5 x 14.0 inches</u> Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: <u>Roya</u> <u>8.5 x 17.0 inches</u>	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.14</u> <u>\$0.14</u> <u>\$0.155</u>	<u>N/A</u> <u>No Bid</u> Royal Printing Tulsa County Additional Cost for <u>Color Distinction</u> <u>\$0.01</u> <u>\$0.00</u> No Bid <u>my</u> <u>\$0.015</u> <u>\$0.00</u>	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing Royal Printing		
Maximum quantity per elect 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 17.0 inches Price per ballot:	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.14</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>No Bid</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing		
Maximum quantity per elec <u>8.5 x 14.0 inches</u> Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: <u>Roya</u> <u>8.5 x 17.0 inches</u>	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.14</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>No Bid</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing Royal Printing		
Maximum quantity per elect 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 17.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.14</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>No Bid</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing Royal Printing		
Maximum quantity per elect 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 17.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 19.0 inches	Unit Price \$0.135 \$0.145 No Bid al Printing Compa \$0.14 \$0.155 No Bid al Printing Compa	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.01 \$0.01 \$0.01 \$0.00 No Bid No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing Royal Printing Tulsa County		
Maximum quantity per elect 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 17.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.14</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>No Bid</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing Royal Printing		
Maximum quantity per elect 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 17.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 19.0 inches	Unit Price \$0.135 \$0.145 No Bid al Printing Compa \$0.14 \$0.155 No Bid al Printing Compa	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.01 \$0.01 \$0.01 \$0.00 No Bid No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing		
Maximum quantity per elect 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 17.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 19.0 inches	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.14</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.15</u> <u>\$0.155</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for Color Distinction \$0.01 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.015 \$0.00 No Bid my \$0.02 \$0.00	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing Royal Printing		
Maximum quantity per elect 8.5 x 14.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 17.0 inches Price per ballot: BID AWARDED TO: Roya 8.5 x 19.0 inches	<u>Unit Price</u> <u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.14</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>No Bid</u> al Printing Compa <u>\$0.15</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>No Bid</u>	N/A Royal Printing No Bid Tulsa County Additional Cost for <u>Color Distinction</u> <u>\$0.01</u> <u>\$0.00</u> No Bid uny <u>\$0.015</u> <u>\$0.00</u> No Bid uny <u>\$0.015</u> <u>\$0.00</u> No Bid uny <u>\$0.02</u> <u>\$0.00</u> No Bid	Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing Royal Printing Tulsa County Mid-West Printing		

SAMPLE BALLOTS

Maximum quantity per election:		N/AMid-West PrintingN/ARoyal PrintingNo BidTulsa County			
	<u>Unit Price</u>	Additional Cost for <u>Color Distinction</u>			
<u>8.5 x 14.0 inches</u> Price per ballot:	<u>\$0.135</u> <u>\$0.145</u> No Pid	<u>\$0.01</u> <u>\$0.00</u> No Pid	Mid-West Printing Royal Printing		
No BidNo BidTulsa CountyBID AWARDED TO: Royal Printing Company					
8.5 x 17.0 inches					
Price per ballot:	<u>\$0.14</u> <u>\$0.155</u> No Bid	<u>\$0.015</u> <u>\$0.00</u> No Bid	Mid-West Printing Royal Printing Tulsa County		
BID AWARDED TO: Royal Printing Company					
<u>8.5 x 19.0 inches</u>					
Price per ballot:	<u>\$0.15</u> <u>\$0.155</u> <u>No Bid</u>	<u>\$0.02</u> <u>\$0.00</u> <u>No Bid</u>	Mid-West Printing Royal Printing Tulsa County		
BID AWARDED TO: Royal Printing Company					

SHIPPING CHARGE

Shipping charge will be included on orders of 200 or fewer ballots. \$10.00	Mid-West Printing
(Bid Prices include all charges for freight, F.O.B. with inside delivery)	

Shipping charge will be included on orders of 200 or fewer ballots. 10.00 Royal Printing (*This charge will only be added if the entire county's quantity (all entities combined for month) is* ≤ 200 ballots

Shipping charge will be included on orders of _____or fewer ballots. \$NO BID Tulsa County

BID AWARDED TO: <u>Royal Printing Company</u>

COLOR DISTINCTION

Describe the color distinction method to be employed where such distinction is required.

Yellow, Pink, Ivory Mid-West Printing Ballot Color Choices Include: Paper (solid colors): White, Yellow, Pink, and Ivory Color Bar Colors: Gray, Black, Cyan, Magenta, Yellow, Red, Green, Dark Blue, Purple, Orange, And Brown