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BEAVER COUNTY 

6 MONTH BIDS #1 TABULATION 

OCTOBER 4, 2021 to APRIL 4, 2022 
 

2 2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE  

                                   16 GA.                               

18”    25.62 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

24”   33.57 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

30”   42.40 DUB ROSS CO.  

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

36” NO BID DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: NO BID 

 

 

2 2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE  
                                   14 GA.                                 

18”   31.60 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

24”   40.99 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

30”   52.27 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

36”   60.88 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

 

3” X 1” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE 
53” X 41”   14 GA.  99.05 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

60” X 46”   14 GA. 111.16 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

66” X 51” 14 GA. 121.99 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

73” X 55” 14 GA. 133.99 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

81” X 59” 14 GA. 145.99 DUB ROSS CO.  

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

87” X 63” 14 GA. 157.90 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

95” X 67” 12 GA.  240.71 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 
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2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE 

 16 GA.  

18” 24.40 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

24” 32.38 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

30” 40.40 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

36” 47.86 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

48” NO BID DUB ROSS CO.   

BID AWARDED TO: NO BID 

 

 

2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE 
 14 GA.  

18” 30.15 DUB ROSS CO.   

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

24” 39.94 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

30” 50.90 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

36” 59.40 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

 

48” 42.74 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

 

3” X 1” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE 
60”     16 GA. 93.02 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

66”     16 GA. 102.18 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

72”     16 GA. 111.34 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

78”     16 GA. 120.48 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

84”     14 GA. 161.90 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

90”     14 GA. 173.33 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

96”     14 GA. 184.77 DUB ROSS CO. 



3 

 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO.  

 

102”   14 GA. 196.20 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

108”   12 GA. 299.76 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

114”   12 GA. 313.50 DUB ROSS CO.  

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 

 

120”   12 GA. 329.86 DUB ROSS CO. 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO. 
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BEAVER COUNTY 

6 MONTH BIDS #2 TABULATION 

OCTOBER 4, 2021 to APRIL 4, 2022 

 
 

CHIPS  TON 

1/2”   NO BID DOLESE BROS. CO. 

1/2”   26.00 J & R SAND CO. 

1/2”   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

1/2”   NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: J & R SAND CO. 

 

3/4”   13.40 DOLESE BROS. CO. 

3/4”   NO BID J & R SAND CO. 

3/4”   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

3/4”   NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING  

 

BID AWARDED TO: DOLESE BROS. CO 

 

3/8”   NO BID DOLESE BROS. CO 

3/8”   NO BID J & R SAND CO. 

3/8”   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

3/8”   NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: NO BID  

 

7/16”   NO BID DOLESE BROS. CO. 

7/16”   NO BID J & R SAND CO. 

7/16”   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

7/16”   NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: NO BID 

 

5/8”   13.60 DOLESE BROS. CO. 

5/8”   NO BID J & R SAND CO. 

5/8”   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

5/8”   NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: DOLESE BROS. CO. 

 

SCREENED ROCK                          TON 

1 1/4”   NB DOLESE BROS. CO. 

1 1/4”   20.00 J & R SAND CO. 

1 1/4”   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

1 1/4”   NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: J&R SAND CO.  

 

1 1/2”   10.65 DOLESE BROS. CO.  

1 1/2”   NO BID J & R SAND CO. 

1 1/2”   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

1 1/2”   NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: DOLESE BROS. CO.  
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ASPHALT HOT MIX   PER TON    

(Supply lay down machine)   NO BID DOLESE BROS. CO. 

   125.00     J & R SAND CO. 

   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

   NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: J & R SAND CO. 

 

 

ASPHALT HOT MIX   PER TON    

(No lay down machine)   NO BID DOLESE BROS. CO. 

   90.00     J & R SAND CO. 

   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

   55.00 CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: CIRCLE S PAVING  

 

 

TACK COAT  GAL.  

(applied)   NO BID DOLESE BROS. CO.  

   4.50/GAL W/ PAVING J & R SAND CO. 

   NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

   NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: J & R SAND CO. 

 

 

POLYMER MODIFIED COLD PATCH 

       TON TON 

          Picked Up    Delivered 

 NO BID      NO BID DOLESE BROS. CO.   

          NO BID      NO BID  J & R SAND CO. 

          104.75       131.00 min 25 LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

          NO BID       NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: LOGAN CO. ASPHALT                                  

 

 

POLYMER MODIFIED COLD PATCH 

       50# BAG               50#BAG  

          Picked Up    Delivered 

 NO BID      NO BID DOLESE BROS. CO.   

          NO BID      NO BID  J & R SAND CO. 

          10.50       13.00 min 50 LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

          NO BID      NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: LOGAN CO. ASPHALT                                  

 

 

HOT MIX -COLD LAY TON 

  NO BID                 DOLESE BROS. CO.   

   NO BID                  J & R SAND CO. 

   NO BID                  LOGAN CO. ASPHALT  

   62.00                  CIRCLE S PAVING 

 

BID AWARDED TO: CIRCLE S PAVING                  
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HAULING (Rock, Asphalt & Road Materials) 

          NO BID DOLESE BROS. CO.  

          2.00 1st mile/ $0.22 each add’l mile J&R SAND CO. 

          NO BID LOGAN CO. ASPHALT 

          NO BID CIRCLE S PAVING  

 

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO.  

 

 

CONCRETE – PER YARD & MILEAGE – PER MILE   

  NO BID                 DOLESE BROS. CO,  

    NO BID                  J & R SAND CO. 

   NO BID                  LOGAN CO. ASPHALT  

   NO BID                  CIRCLE S PAVING  

 

BID AWARDED TO NO BID 
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BEAVER COUNTY 

6 MONTH BIDS #3 TABULATIONS 

OCTOBER 4, 2021 to APRIL 4, 2022 
 

MC 70 GAL. NO BID VANCE BROS. INC.  

MC 70 GAL. NO BID ERGON  

MC 70 GAL. 2.54  COASTAL ENERGY CORP. 

 

BID AWARDED TO COASTAL ENERGY CORP. 

 

 

MC 800 GAL. NO BID VANCE BROS. INC.  

MC 800 GAL. NO BID ERGON 

MC 800 GAL. 2.34 COASTAL ENERGY CORP.  

 

 

BID AWARDED TO COASTAL ENERGY CORP. 

 

 

MC 800 + GAL. NO BID VANCE BROS. INC.  

MC 800 + GAL. NO BID ERGON  

MC 800 + GAL. 2.59 COASTAL ENERGY CORP.  

 

BID AWARDED TO COASTAL ENERGY CORP. 

 

 

EMULSION – CRS – 2      GAL. 2.20 VANCE BROS. INC. 

EMULSION – CRS – 2      GAL. 2.09 ERGON 

EMULSION – CRS – 2      GAL. 2.09 COASTAL ENERGY CORP. 

 

BID AWARDED TO ERGON & COASTAL ENERGY CORP. 

 

 

EMULSION – CRS – 2 +     GAL.  2.40 VANCE BROS. INC.  

EMULSION – CRS – 2 +     GAL.  2.24 ERGON 

EMULSION – CRS – 2 +     GAL.    2.36 COASTAL ENERGY CORP. 

 

BID AWARDED TO ERGON  

 

 

RETURN FREIGHT 

$1000.00   VANCE BROS. INC. 

PUMP CHARGE: $75.00        

DEMURRAGE: $70 PER HR/AFTER 2 HRS 

MINIMUM DELLIVERY LOAD IS 5,500 GALLONS 

 

½ FREIGHT        ERGON 

PUMP CHARGE: $70.00        

DEMURRAGE: $70 PER HR/AFTER 2 HRS 

MIN FREIGHT – 47,000 LBS  

FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL FEE- $.00150 PER GAL. 

 

900.00   COASTAL ENERGY CORP. 

PUMP CHARGE: $75.00        

DEMURRAGE: $75 PER HR/AFTER 2 HRS 

SHORT FREIGHT CHARGE- $775.00 FOR LOADS LESS THAN 5,500 GALLONS 
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BEAVER COUNTY 

6 MONTH BIDS #4 TABULATIONS 

OCTOBER 4, 2021 to APRIL 4, 2022 
   

  

PILE  L.F. 

HP 10X42  35.80 THE RAILROAD YARD 

HP 10X42  35.70  SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

HP 10X42  NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

HP 10X42  NO BID  PAY DIRT  

 

BID AWARDED TO: SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 

 

 

HP 12X53          49.95 THE RAILROAD YARD 

HP 12X53          45.00 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

HP 12X53          NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

HP 12X53          NO BID PAY DIRT  

 

BID AWARDED TO: SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

 

 

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  30.63 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 

 

 

PILE DRIVING  

HP 10X42  NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

HP 10X42  NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

HP 10X42  250.00/HOUR DIETZ WELDING 

HP 10X42  NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: DIETZ WELDING  

 

 

HP 12X53  NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

HP 12X53  NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

HP 12X53  250.00/HOUR DIETZ WELDING 

HP 12X53  NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: DIETZ WELDING  

 

 

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  250.00/HOUR DIETZ WELDING 

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe  NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: DIETZ WELDING  
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STRUCTURAL STEEL (I&H Beams) A-36 

New         Per lb.  1.03 THE RAILROAD YARD 

New         Per lb.  .895 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

New         Per lb.  NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

New         Per lb.  NO BID  PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

 

 

Used         Per lb.  .42  THE RAILROAD YARD 

Used         Per lb.  NO BID  SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

Used         Per lb.  NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

Used         Per lb.  NO BID  PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: THE RAILROAD YARD  

 

 

STRUCTURAL STEEL (Angles & Channels) A-36 

New         Per lb.    .92 THE RAILROAD YARD 

New         Per lb.    .899 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

New         Per lb.    NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

New         Per lb.    NO BID  PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: SUNBELT EQUIPMENT   

 

 

Used         Per lb.  NO BID  THE RAILROAD YARD 

Used         Per lb.  .45 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

Used         Per lb.  NO BID  DIETZ WELDING 

Used         Per lb.  NO BID  PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

 

 

18” GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: NO BID  

 

 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 10.95 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 
 
 

21.7” GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 10.87 THE RAILROAD YARD 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID  SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID  DIETZ WELDING 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID  PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: THE RAILROAD YARD 
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10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 13.85 THE RAILROAD YARD 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID  SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: THE RAILROAD YARD 
 

 

2’ WIDE GALVANIZED STEEL BRIDGE PLANKS 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: NO BID 
 

 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID PAY DIRT  

 

BID AWARDED TO: NO BID  

 

 

REBAR GRADE 60  Per Ft. 

1/2”   .47 THE RAILROAD YARD 

1/2”   .48 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

1/2”   NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

1/2”   NO BID  PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: THE RAILROAD YARD 

 

 

5/8”   .72 THE RAILROAD YARD 

5/8”   .74 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

5/8”   NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

5/8”   NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: THE RAILROAD YARD 

 

 

CRANE RENTAL 

15 Ton Minimum/ Hour          NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

15 Ton Minimum/ Hour          NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 

15 Ton Minimum/ Hour          250.00 DIETZ WELDING 

15 Ton Minimum/ Hour          NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: DIETZ WELDING  

 

 

TRACKHOE  

      Per hour                      NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

      Per hour                      NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT 

      Per hour                      200.00 DIETZ WELDING 

      Per hour                      200.00 PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: DIETZ WELDING & PAY DIRT 
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FORKLIFT  

      Per Hour                     NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

      Per hour                      NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

      Per hour                      NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

      Per hour                      NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: NO BID 

 

 

GUARD RAILING                  Per Ft. 

New                       12.10 THE RAILROAD YARD 

New                       10.45 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

New                       NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

New                       NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

 

 

Used                       4.50 THE RAILROAD YARD 

Used                       NO BID  SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

Used                       NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

Used                       NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: THE RAILROAD YARD 

 

 

STAY INPLACE FORMING Sq. Ft. 

22 Gauge                       1.52 THE RAILROAD YARD 

22 Gauge                       5.90 SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

22 Gauge                       NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

22 Gauge                       NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: THE RAILROAD YARD  

 

 

24 Gauge                       NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD 

24 Gauge                       NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

24 Gauge                       NO BID DIETZ WELDING 

24 Gauge                       NO BID PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO: NO BID 

 

 

OKLAHOMA CERTIFIED STRUCTURAL WELDING                      

Per Hour                 NO BID  THE RAILROAD YARD 

Per Hour                 NO BID SUNBELT EQUIPMENT  

Per Hour                 75.00 DIETZ WELDING 

Per Hour                 NO BID  PAY DIRT 

 

BID AWARDED TO DIETZ WELDING  
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BEAVER COUNTY 

6 MONTH BIDS #5 TABULATION 

OCTOBER 4, 2021 to APRIL 4, 2022 
 

GRADER RADIAL TIRES 

1400 x 24 687.20 SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

1400 x 24 735.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  

1400 x 24 750.00 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

1400 x 24 NO BID T&W TIRE 

 

BID AWARDED TO: SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

 

TRUCK RADIAL TIRES 

1100 x 22.5      233.00 SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

1100 x 22.5     HIGHWAY 288.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 

1100 x 22.5 270.00 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

1100 x 22.5 NO BID T&W TIRE 

 

BID AWARDED TO: SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC 

 

1100 x 22.5      289.74 SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

1100 x 22.5     STEERING 285.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 

1100 x 22.5 270.00 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

1100 x 22.5 NO BID T&W TIRE  

 

BID AWARDED TO: TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

 

1100 x 22.5      317.23 SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC 

1100 x 22.5     ALLSEASON 290.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 

1100 x 22.5 280.00 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

1100 x 22.5 NO BID T&W TIRE  

 

BID AWARDED TO: TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

 

1100 x 24.5      244.00 SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

1100 x 24.5     HIGHWAY 290.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 

1100 x 24.5     280.00                      TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

1100 x 24.5     NO BID             T&W TIRE  

 

BID AWARDED TO: SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC 

 

1100 x 24.5      300.23 SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

1100 x 24.5     STEERING 290.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 

1100 x 24.5 280.00 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

1100 x 24.5 NO BID T&W TIRE 

 

BID AWARDED TO: TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

 

1100 x 24.5      338.46 SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

1100 x 24.5     ALL SEASON 304.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 

1100 x 24.5 290.00 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

1100 x 24.5 NO BID T&W TIRE  

 

BID AWARDED TO: TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 
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TRACTOR TIRES 

18.4 R 38                                            1,341.60 SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

18.4 R 38                                            959.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 

18.4 R 38 875.00 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

18.4 R 38 NO BID T&W TIRE 

 

BID AWARDED TO:   TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

 

14.9 R 28 808.50 SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

14.9 R 28 725.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 

14.9 R 28 595.00 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

14.9 R 28 NO BID T&W TIRE 

 

BID AWARDED TO: TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

 

14.9 R 24 650.02  SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC  

14.9 R 24 719.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 

14.9 R 24     565.00                           TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE 

14.9 R 24     NO BID                          T&W TIRE  

 

BID AWARDED TO: TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE   
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BEAVER COUNTY 

6 MONTHS BIDS #6 TABULATION 

OCTOBER 4, 2021 to APRIL 4, 2022 
 

GRADER BLADES                          PER FT. 

 

5/8 X 6   (WITH 5/8 HOLES)                 15.94                            KIRBY SMITH MACHINERY INC  

                                                                  7.90                             WARREN CAT 

                                    10.45    DUB ROSS CO., INC. 

                  17.20    WEAR PARTS & EQUIP. CO., INC. 

 

BID AWARDED TO: WARREN CAT  

 

 

5/8 X 8    (WITH 5/8 HOLES)                  22.44                           KIRBY SMITH MACHINERY INC  

                                                                   10.88    WARREN CAT 

 14.12     DUB ROSS CO., INC. 

 21.31     WEAR PARTS & EQUIP. CO., INC. 

 

BID AWARDED TO: WARREN CAT 

 

 

5/8 X 6    (WITH 3/4 HOLES)                  17.06                            KIRBY SMITH MACHINERY INC  

                                                                   12.31                            WARREN CAT 

              10.45     DUB ROSS CO., INC. 

              17.20     WEAR PARTS & EQUIP. CO., INC. 

 

BID AWARDED TO: DUB ROSS CO., INC.  

 

 

5/8 X 8    (WITH 3/4 HOLES)                  23.25                            KIRBY SMITH MACHINERY INC  

                                                                   10.88                           WARREN CAT 

                           14.12     DUB ROSS CO., INC.    

              21.31     WEAR PARTS & EQUIP. CO., INC.                    

  

BID AWARDED TO: WARREN CAT 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


