BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #1 TABULATION
SEPTEMBER 8, 2015 TO MARCH 21, 2016

2 2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE

16 GA.
187 10.48 DUB ROSS CO.
187 NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS
24” 14.22 DUB ROSS CO.
24” NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS
307 17.65 DUB ROSS CO.
307 NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS
36” NO BID DUB ROSS CO.
36” NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO NO BID
48” NO BID DUB ROSS CO.
48” NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

2 2/3” X 1/2” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE

14 GA.

18” 13.08 DUB ROSS CO.

18”7 NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

24” 16.93 DUB ROSS CO.

24” NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

307 20.82 DUB ROSS CO.

307 NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

36” 24.90 DUB ROSS CO.

36” NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

48” 36.81 DUB ROSS CO.

48” NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

3” X 1” ARCHED CORRUGATED PIPE

537X 41”7 14 GA. 39.93 DUB ROSS CO.
537X 41” 14 GA. NOBID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS



60” X 46” 14 GA. 44.30
60” X 46” 14 GA. NOBID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

66”7 X 51” 14 GA. 48.48
66” X 517 14 GA. NOBID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

737 X 55”7 14 GA. 53.45
737X 55” 14 GA. NOBID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

817X 59” 14 GA. 58.60
817X 59” 14 GA. NOBID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

877X 63” 14 GA. 63.51
877X 63” 14 GA. NOBID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

957X 677 12 GA. 89.19
957X 67”7 12 GA. NOBID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE

16 GA.
9.80
NO BID

1 895
187

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

24”
247

13.10
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

30”
30”

16.41
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

36”
36”

19.88
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

48”
48”

33.00
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

60~ NO BID
60~ NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

2 2/3” X 1/2” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE

14 GA.
12.47
NO BID

189’
189’

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD



24”
24”

16.30
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

3 O’J
307

20.19
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

36”
36”

24.20
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

48>
48>

31.90
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

60” 44.50
60” NO BID
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

3” X 1” ROUND CORRUGATED PIPE

60” 16 GA. 30.90

60” 16 GA. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS
66” 16 GA. 42.85

66” 16 GA. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS
727 16 GA. 46.78

727 16 GA. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS
78”7 16 GA. 50.55

78”7 16 GA. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS
84” 14 GA. 66.30

84” 14 GA. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS
90” 14 GA. 70.97

90” 14 GA. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

96” 14 GA. 75.38

96” 14 GA. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS
102” 14 GA. 80.50

102” 14 GA. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD

DUB ROSS CO.
THE RAILROAD YARD



108” 12 GA. 115.10 DUB ROSS CO.

108” 12 GA. NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

1147 12 GA. 120.90 DUB ROSS CO.

1147 12 GA. NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD
BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

120” 12 GA. 127.10 DUB ROSS CO.

120” 12 GA. NO BID THE RAILROAD YARD

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS

CORRUGATED POLYPROPYLENE PIPE (AASHTO M330)

127 6.30/LF DUB ROSS CO.

12” Coupler 6.30/EACH

12”7 6.02/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
12” Coupler 6.02/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD

157 9.35/LF DUB ROSS CO.

15” Coupler 9.35/EACH

157 8.98/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
15” Coupler 8.98/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD

18”7 12.05/LF DUB ROSS CO.

18” Coupler 12.05/EACH

18” 11.56/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
18” Coupler 11.56/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD

217 17.35/LF DUB ROSS CO.

21” Coupler 17.35/EACH

217 16.66/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
21” Coupler 16.66/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD

247 20.00/LF DUB ROSS CO.

24” Coupler 20.00/EACH

24” 19.24/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
24” Coupler 19.24/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD

THE RAILROAD YARD ** MINIMUM $4,000 ORDER OR $50 DROP FEE APPLIES




307 31.00/LF DUB ROSS CO.

30” Coupler 31.00/EACH

30” 29.89/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
30” Coupler 29.89/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD

36” 34.30/LF DUB ROSS CO.

36” Coupler 34.30/EACH

36” 33.27/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
36” Coupler 33.27/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD

42”7 42.40/LF DUB ROSS CO.

42” Coupler 42.40/EACH

427 41.07/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
42” Coupler 41.07/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD

48” 56.75/LF DUB ROSS CO.

48” Coupler 56.75/EACH

48” 55.06/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
48” Coupler 55.06/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD

60” 79.10/LF DUB ROSS CO.

60” Coupler 79.10/EACH

60” 76.86/LF THE RAILROAD YARD
60” Coupler 76.86/EACH

BID AWARDED TO RAILROAD YARD




BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #2 TABULATION

SEPTEMBER 8, 2015 TO MARCH 21, 2016

CHIPS TON
1/2” NO BID
127 NO BID
127 18.00
1/27 NO BID
BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO.

3/4” 10.15
3/4” NO BID
3/4” NO BID
3/4” NO BID
BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROTHERS
3/8” 10.55
3/8” NO BID
3/8” NO BID
3/8” NO BID
BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROTHERS
5/8” 10.35
5/8” NO BID
5/8” NO BID
5/8” NO BID
BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROTHERS
SCREENED ROCK TON
11/4” 10.00

1 1/4” NO BID
1 1/4” 20.00

1 1/4” NO BID
BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROTHERS
11/27 9.15
11/2” NO BID
11/2” 18.00
11/2” NO BID

BID AWARDED TO DOLESE BROTHERS

ASPHALT TYPE B (NO PAVER) PER TON
NO BID
85.00
82.50
NO BID
BID AWARDED TO J & SAND CO.

ASPHALT TYPE B (W/PAVER) PER TON
NO BID
95.00
102.50
NO BID
BID AWARDED TO HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & R SAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & RSAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & R SAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & R SAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & RSAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & R SAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & RSAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & R SAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT




ASPHALT TYPE D (NO PAVER) PER TON

NO BID
NO BID
92.50

NO BID

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO.

ASPHALT TYPE D (W/PAVER) PER TON

NO BID
NO BID
112.50

NO BID

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO.

TACK COAT

BID AWARDED TO HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS & J & R SAND CO.

GAL.
NO BID
4.00 (if asphalt is supplied by HCI)

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & R SAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & RSAND CO.

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS

4.00 (if asphalt is supplied by J&R)

J & R SAND CO.

NO BID

POLYMER MODIFIED COLD PATCH

TON EFOB
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
99.75
8.50/50# BAG

DELIVERED
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

128.50

10.50 50# BAG

BID AWARDED TO LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT

HOT MIX COLD LAY

TON
NO BID

100.00 (@ Guymon Yard when available)

LOGAN CO. ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & RSAND CO.

LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT
LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS

NO BID
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS

HAULING (Rock, Asphalt & Road Materials)

(Bid per T. plus mileage)
(Bid per T. plus mileage)
(Bid per T. plus mileage)
(Bid per T. plus mileage)

NO BID
NO BID
2.00 1° mile/ $0.20 each add’l mile
NO BID

BID AWARDED TO J & R SAND CO.

CONCRETE - PER YARD
MILEAGE - PER MILE

BID AWARDED TO NO BID
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NO BID
NO BID

J & RSAND CO.
LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J&R SAND CO.

LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT

DOLESE BROTHERS
HIGHWAY CONTRACTORS
J & RSAND CO.

LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT




BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #3 TABULATIONS

SEPTEMBER 8, 2015 TO MARCH 21, 2016

MC 70 GAL. 2.952
MC 70 GAL. 3.15
MC 70 GAL. 3.335

BID AWARDED TO ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY

MC 800 GAL. 2.752

MC 800 GAL. 2.72

MC 800 GAL. 2.885

BID AWARDED TO COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
MC 800 + GAL. NO BID

MC 800 + GAL. 2.74

MC 800 + GAL. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO COASTAL ENERGY CORP.

MC 3000 GAL. 2.652
MC 3000 GAL. 2.69
MC 3000 GAL. 2.785

BID AWARDED TO ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY

EMULSION-CRS-2 GAL. NOBID
EMULSION-CRS-2 GAL. 1.82
EMULSION-CRS-2 GAL. 1.835

BID AWARDED TO COASTAL ENERGY CORP.

EMULSION-CRS-2+ GAL. NOBID
EMULSION-CRS-2+ GAL. 1.98
EMULSION-CRS-2+ GAL. 2.035

BID AWARDED TO COASTAL ENERGY CORP.

RETURN FREIGHT
2,154.60

875.00

Y% FREIGHT

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
ERGON ASPHALT

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
ERGON ASPHALT

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
ERGON ASPHALT

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
ERGON ASPHALT

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
ERGON ASPHALT

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
ERGON ASPHALT

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
COASTAL ENERGY CORP.
ERGON ASPHALT




BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #4 TABULATIONS

SEPTEMBER 8, 2015 TO MARCH 21, 2016

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD

PILE L.F.
HP 10X42 21.00

HP 10X42 20.32

HP 10X42 20.32

BID AWARDED TO THE RAILROAD YARD & SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY
HP 12X53 30.00

HP 12X53 26.38

HP 12X53 26.45

BID AWARDED TO THE RAILROAD YARD
10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe 17.00

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe NO BID

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe 18.50

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION
PILE DRIVING

HP 10X42 15.00

HP 10X42 NO BID

HP 10X42 NO BID
BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION
HP 12X53 20.00

HP 12X53 NO BID

HP 12X53 NO BID
BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION
10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe 15.00

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe NO BID

10” X 3/8” Wall Pipe NO BID

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION

SRUCTURAL STEEL (I&H Beams) A-36

New Per Ib. 00.50

New Per Ib. 00.54

New Per Ib. 00.495

BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY
Used Per Ib. 00.40

Used Per Ib. 00.319

Used Per Ib. 00.32

BID AWARDED TO THE RAILROAD YARD

SRUCTURAL STEEL (Angles & Channels) A-36

New Per Ib. 00.4995
New Per Ib. 00.509
New Per Ib. 00.504

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION

SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY



Used Per Ib. 00.40

Used Per Ib. 00.35

Used Per Ib. NO BID
BID AWARDED TO THE RAILROAD YARD

18” GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.32

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.32

BID AWARDED TO THE RAILROAD YARD & SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 5.32

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 5.35

BID AWARDED TO THE RAILROAD YARD

21.7” GALVANIZED INTERLOCKING SHEETING

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. 4.32

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID
BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. 5.32

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION

2’ WIDE GALVANIZED STEEL BRIDGE PLANKS

12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID
12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID
12 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID
10 Gauge Sq. Ft. NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

REBAR GRADE 60 Per Ft.
1/2” 00.35
1/2” 00.297
1/2” 00.28
BID AWARDED TO SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY
5/8” 00.50
5/8” 00.459
5/8” 00.46

BID AWARDED TO THE RAILROAD YARD

CRANE RENTAL

15 Ton Minimum/ Hour 175.00
15 Ton Minimum/ Hour NO BID
15 Ton Minimum/ Hour NO BID

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION

10

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY



TRACKHOE

Per hour 125.00

Per hour NO BID

Per hour NO BID
BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION
FORKLIFT

Per Hour 50.00

Per Hour NO BID

Per Hour NO BID
BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION
GUARD RAILING Per Ft.
New 7.95
New NO BID
New 8.25
BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION
Used 2.95
Used 2.90
Used 3.25

BID AWARDED TO THE RAILROAD YARD

STAY INPLACE FORMING Sq. Ft.

22 Gauge 1.18

22 Gauge 1.23

22 Gauge 1.19

BID AWARDED TO K& O CONSTRUCTION
24 Gauge 1.18

24 Gauge NO BID

24 Gauge NO BID

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION

OKLAHOMA CERTIFIED STRUCTURAL WELDING

Per Hour 75.00
Per Hour NO BID
Per Hour NO BID

BID AWARDED TO K & O CONSTRUCTION

11

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY

K & O CONSTRUCTION
THE RAILROAD YARD
SUNBELT EQUIP. & SUPPLY



BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BID #5 TABULATIONS
SEPTEMBER 8, 2015 TO MARCH 21, 2016

Roundup (Generic Equivalent)

2.5 Gallon NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

30 Gallon NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Bulk NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Amine 2-4D

2.5 Gallon NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

30 Gallon NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Bulk NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Banvel

2.5 Gallon NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

30 Gallon NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Bulk NO BID NO BID

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Ally (Generic Equivalent)
Per Gallon NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

30 Gallon NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Bulk NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Surfactant

2.5 Gallon NO BID NO BID

BID AWARDED TO NO BID

30 Gallon NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Bulk NO BID NO BID
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

12



Liquid Ammonia Sulfate
2.5 Gallon
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

30 Gallon
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Bulk
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

LV6 2-4-D
2.5 Gallon
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

30 Gallon
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Bulk
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

CROP OIL
2.5 Gallon
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

30 Gallon
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Bulk
BID AWARDED TO NO BID

Dry Ammonia Sulfate per Ib.
BID AWARDED TO NO BID
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NO BID

z
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NO BID

NO BID

13

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #6
SEPTEMBER 8, 2015 TO MARCH 21, 2016

GRADER RADIAL TIRES

1400 x 24 652.28 SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1400 x 24 825.00 K & S TIRE INC.

1400 x 24 625.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.
1400 x 24 650.00 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE

BID AWARDED TO DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.

TRUCK RADIAL TIRES

1100 x22.5 HIGHWAY 178.79 SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 22.5 245.00 K & S TIRE INC.

1100 x 22.5 201.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.
1100 x 22.5 196.91 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE
BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 22.5 STEERING 182.58 SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 22.5 260.00 K &S TIRE INC.

1100 x 22.5 201.30 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.
1100 x 22.5 228.38 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE

BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 22.5 ALL SEASON 178.79 SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 22.5 270.00 K & S TIRE INC.

1100 x 22.5 220.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.
1100 x 22.5 227.70 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE
BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 24.5 HIGHWAY 194.89 SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 24.5 260.00 K &S TIRE INC.

1100 x 24.5 220.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.
1100 x 24.5 231.59 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE
BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 24.5 STEERING 198.17 SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 24.5 275.00 K & S TIRE INC.

1100 x 24.5 222.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.
1100 x 24.5 245.75 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE
BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 24.5 ALL SEASON 194.89 SOUTHERN TIRE MART

1100 x 24.5 300.00 K &S TIRE INC.

1100 x 24.5 214.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.
1100 x 24.5 239.45 TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE

BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART
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TRACTOR TIRES

18.4R 38 829.97

18.4R 38 1050.00
18.4R 38 885.00

18.4R 38 850.00

BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART
149R 28 539.55

149 R 28 595.00

149R 28 559.00

149R 28 625.00

BID AWARDED TO SOUTHERN TIRE MART
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SOUTHERN TIRE MART

K &S TIRE INC.

DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.
TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE

SOUTHERN TIRE MART

K & S TIRE INC.

DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE INC.
TIRE DEALERS WAREHOUSE



GRADER BLADES PER FT.
5/8 X 6 (WITH 5/8 HOLES) 9.83
11.71

8.24

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS CO., INC.
5/8 X8 (WITH 5/8 HOLES) 13.33
26.09

11.60

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS CO., INC.
5/8 X6 (WITH 3/4 HOLES) NO BID
11.71

8.24

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS CO., INC.
5/8 X8 (WITH 3/4 HOLES) NO BID
15.10
11.60

BID AWARDED TO DUB ROSS CO., INC.

BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #7
SEPTEMBER 8, 2015 TO MARCH 21, 2016
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YELLOWHOUSE MACHINERY
WARREN CAT
DUB ROSS CO., INC.

YELLOWHOUSE MACHINERY
WARREN CAT
DUB ROSS CO., INC.

YELLOWHOUSE MACHINERY
WARREN CAT
DUB ROSS CO., INC.

YELLOWHOUSE MACHINERY
WARREN CAT
DUB ROSS CO., INC.



BEAVER COUNTY
6 MONTHS BIDS #8
SEPTEMBER 8, 2015 TO MARCH 21, 2016
PRODUCT FOR USE WITH EXTREME PRESSURE GEAR OILS

Price per 20 liter pail $796.05 Product Name: Power Up NNL690G
BID AWARDED TO SOUTHWEST KLEEN POWER

PRODUCT FOR USE WITH HYDRAULIC AND/OR RECIRCULATING OIL ONLY

Price per 20 liter pail $856.00 Product Name: Power Up Hydramaxx
BID AWARDED TO SOUTHWEST KLEEN POWER

PRODUCT FOR ENGINE CRANKCASE; AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION; POWER SHIFT
TRANSMISSION; HYDRAULIC AND/OR RECIRCULATING SYSTEMS

Price per 20 liter pail $796.05 Product Name: Power Up NNL690

BID AWARDED TO SOUTHWEST KLEEN POWER

DIESEL ADDITIVE
Price: 20 liter pail $681.00 — Case of 5 liters (4 containers per case) $603.00  Product Name: Gen49D
BID AWARDED TO SOUTHWEST KLEEN POWER

17



